

EXHIBIT 2

Montera v. Premier Nutrition, Case No. 3:16-CV-06980 RS
Blood Hurst & O'Reardon, LLP

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.75	\$960.00	\$1,680.00	2/12/2013	Revise complaint
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	3/5/2013	revise complaint
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	3/7/2013	revise complaint and circulate to co-counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	3/14/2013	continue revising complaint; exchange comms with co-counsel about draft complaint
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	3/15/2013	Work on complaint
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	3/15/2013	continue revising complaint including pull and review studies relating to GH and incorporate into complaint and circulate revised complaint to co-counsel
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	3/17/2013	Work on complaint and follow up on A. Levitt's questions and comments
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	3/18/2013	review and incorporate edits from T. Blood and Adam Levitt and revise complaint
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	3/22/2013	Follow up on filing issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	3/28/2013	call with T Carpenter about complaints
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/2/2013	call with T Carpenter about complaints and clients, and have call with T. Blood about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	5/21/2013	review Local Rule and R26 requirements and ESI standing orders; review defs answer

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	5/22/2013	meet with G Laval about first set of discovery; research ESI predictive coding law and review LRs on ESI and draft letter to defense counsel regarding preservation and ESI issues
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	3.50	\$335.00	\$1,172.50	5/22/2013	Read complaint; draft Request for Production, Request for Admission & Interrogatories
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/23/2013	Follow up with co-counsel on pressing litigation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	5/23/2013	review first set of interrogatories, document requests and RFAs and make edits to same and send to G Laval for review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	5/29/2013	finalize ESI letter, technology systems overview request; draft proposed confidentiality order and review LRs about same and ND Cal model order; exchange comms with DTI about native format production protocol and research language for same and send materials to A Garganta for review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	5/30/2013	review native format protocols, call with DTI about same, and finalize proposed format protocol and send to defense counsel; review local ADR rules and exchange comms with opposing counsel about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	6/3/2013	Review local rules, ESI Guidelines and letter received today in preparation for Rule 26f tomorrow.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	6/4/2013	Conference with T. O'Reardon in preparation for Rule 26 conference; Telephone conference with defense counsel regarding Rule 26 conference and mediation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	6/4/2013	prepare for and have Rule 26f conference with defense counsel; review stipulation to extend CMC
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	6/18/2013	Research court rules regarding telephonic participation at hearings
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	6/24/2013	Telephone conference with defense counsel regarding discovery and possible mediation; Follow up on same; Follow up with ADR department of ND Cal.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	6/24/2013	prepare for and have R26f call with defense counsel; calls with ADR about rescheduling; have call with T Blood and A Levitt about potential settlement strategy and disco issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	6/25/2013	call with T Blood, A Garganta and ADR attorney and follow up call about same; draft stipulation and proposed order contiuing CMC
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/26/2013	Revise letter to district court judge.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/26/2013	draft letter to judge Seeborg regarding continuance and circulate to Attorney T. Blood and A Garganta for review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/27/2013	call with A Garganta about draft request for continuance
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/8/2013	call with A Garganta about mediation dates and call Martin Quinn's assistant about same; confirm date wit A Garganta and finalize proposed stip and order and transmittal letter
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/10/2013	finalize jt mtn for extension and exchange comms with A Garganta about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	8/14/2013	review Cabral v. Supple cert order
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	9/4/2013	exchange comms with defense counsel about mediation dates
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	10/30/2013	Prepare for telephone conference with defense counsel regarding discovery for mediation; Participate in telephone conference with defense counsel; Telephone conference with T. O'Reardon regarding various related issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	11/11/2013	review defs edits to proposed confidentiality order and make redlines and send doc compare of same to defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/13/2013	exchange comms with defense counsel about treatment of mediation documents and misc disco issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/14/2013	follow up with J Siprut about mediation information from client

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/18/2013	call with T Blood and A Levitt about mediation and disco status
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	11/19/2013	follow up on status of pltf's mediation disco responses; review expert declarations in Moheb v Nutramax case and begin preparing mediation brief; follow up with defense counsel on mediation docs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	11/21/2013	draft mediation statement, review science and marketing exemplars; call with Rachel Chanin about def's edits to protective order; follow up with co-counsel about pltf mediation disco
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.75	\$710.00	\$4,792.50	11/26/2013	continue drafting mediation brief and reviewing applicable science and exchange comms with defense counsel about same; finalize and serve mediation brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	11/27/2013	call with T Carpenter about mediation and science issues; gather materials to prepare T Blood for mediation; review Defs mediation brief and investigate into Defs expert
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	12/2/2013	Plan & Prepare for mediation; Telephone conference with A. Levitt
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	12/2/2013	review relevant studies and meet with T Blood to prepare for tomorrow's mediation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	12.00	\$960.00	\$11,520.00	12/3/2013	Prepare for and participate in mediation and travel to and from San Francisco
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	12/3/2013	analyze sales data and call with T Blood about same; exchange comms with T Blood about today's mediation; draft and circulate CMC statement
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	12/5/2013	work on first sets of discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	12/6/2013	revise CLRA letter and demand
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/9/2013	call with T Blood and T Carpenter about potential settlement; call with T Blood about disco to be served

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	12/10/2013	work on draft rogs, RFPs and RFAs and first 30b6 notice and exchange comms with T Blood about same; meet with G Laval about initial disclosures
Blood, Timothy	Partner	9.00	\$960.00	\$8,640.00	12/12/2013	Travel to and from and attend initial status conference and prepare for same; Inform co-counsel of proceeding; Review scheduling order
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	12/12/2013	work on CMC
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	12/18/2013	research premier and joint juice corporate structure and relevant third parties and draft and serve initial disclosures; review defs initial disclosures
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	1/20/2014	review and revise protective order and send same to defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/21/2014	review Ds edits to protective order and follow up with them about same and 30b6 deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	1/23/2014	finalize and file protective order
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	1/28/2014	review amended confidentiality order sent by R Chanin
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	1/29/2014	review ND Cal model protective order and edits sent by R Channin and make redlines to same and circulate with comments
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/5/2014	disco meet and confer
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	2/10/2014	draft marketing agency subpoena requests and follow up with Adam L about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	2/12/2014	prepare for and have meet and confer with defense counsel about Ds disco responses and follow up with A Levitt about same; draft and send comm memorializing m&c
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	2/20/2014	follow up with defense counsel about discovery status and call with AG about same

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/21/2014	review GT letter and follow up about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	2/24/2014	review defs discovery requests and follow up with J Siprut about same and begin drafting responses to same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/25/2014	call with EA about subpoena docs and prepare database issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	2/27/2014	follow up with AG about disco extension and CLRA amendment; follow up with co-counsel about disco response status
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	2/28/2014	review and incorporate JS's edits from client into disco responses and follow up about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	3/10/2014	finalize disco responses and follow up with Joe S about same; follow up with AG about possible extension
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	3/13/2014	review letter from GT about outstanding disco issues and draft and send response to same; review proposed ESI keywords from GT and make edits and circulate same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	3/18/2014	review correspondence from GT about 30b6 notice
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	3/21/2014	review correspondence from GT about ESI and follow up on same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/7/2014	review ESI proposals from GT and follow up with him about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	4/22/2014	follow up with GT about depositions; draft second set of interrogatories; draft second PMK notice and circulate
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	4/23/2014	prepare and serve 2d set of RFPs; review docs produced by eleven and exchange comms with EA about same including records verification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	4/24/2014	exchange comms with counsel about disco; review eleven docs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	4/28/2014	prepare for and have meet and confer about outstanding disco issues with defense counsel

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	4/29/2014	Telephone conference with co-counsel regarding upcoming depositions, discovery and status of settlement
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	4/29/2014	call with co-counsel about disco status and review outstanding disco needs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/30/2014	review comm from GT about supplemental ESI, research custodian issues, and follow up with GT about disco
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	5/2/2014	follow up with GT about supplemental disco issues; review docs in database and follow up with DTI about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/7/2014	organize doc productions and doc database protocol
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.75	\$335.00	\$2,931.25	5/7/2014	Read complaint; document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/8/2014	follow up with DTI about doc database issues
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	5/8/2014	Document review
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.75	\$335.00	\$1,591.25	5/9/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/9/2014	follow up with defense counsel about discovery issues
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	7.25	\$335.00	\$2,428.75	5/13/2014	Document review
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	7.50	\$335.00	\$2,512.50	5/14/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	5/15/2014	prepare for and have meet and confer with defense counsel about disco status and depositions and follow up with Ed A about same; follow up with DTI about doc database
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	5/15/2014	Document review
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	5/16/2014	Document review

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/16/2014	follow up with GL about doc review issues
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	5/19/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/19/2014	coordinate with GL about document review issues
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	5/20/2014	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding outstanding discovery and request for additional time.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.00	\$710.00	\$2,130.00	5/20/2014	depo preparation and 30b6 notice
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	5/20/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.75	\$710.00	\$3,372.50	5/21/2014	call with TB and AG about depositions and disco schedule; draft retailer subpoenas; review docs for palumbo deposition; draft fourth set of disco
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	5/21/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/22/2014	disco call and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	7.25	\$335.00	\$2,428.75	5/22/2014	Document search and review for deposition
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	5/23/2014	Document search and review for deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/23/2014	work on deposition preparation and disco
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/27/2014	review responses to 2d and 3d sets of disco received today
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	5/27/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	5/28/2014	Document review and deposition preparation

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	5/28/2014	draft additional retailer document subpoenas; call with Todd C about disco and depo strategy; follow up with defense counsel about deposition issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/29/2014	call with EA about retailer subpoenas
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	5/30/2014	call with SuperValue counsel and exchange comms with EA about subpoenas; draft amended 30b6 notice and follow up on deposition dates
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.00	\$335.00	\$1,340.00	6/2/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.25	\$335.00	\$2,763.75	6/3/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.75	\$710.00	\$5,502.50	6/4/2014	continue preparing for friday's deposition of ritterbush and exchange comms throughout day about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.75	\$710.00	\$8,342.50	6/5/2014	continue preparing for tomorrows ritterbush deposition
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	3.75	\$585.00	\$2,193.75	6/5/2014	Talked with TO re drafting motion to extend discovery deadlines. Reviewed local rules for filing motions to extend deadlines. Drafted motion.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.75	\$710.00	\$3,372.50	6/5/2014	travel to San Fran and prepare for tomorrow's deposition of D Ritterbush
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.75	\$335.00	\$2,931.25	6/5/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/5/2014	Conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding deposition and other discovery issues.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	6/6/2014	Work on motion for extension
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	6.75	\$585.00	\$3,948.75	6/6/2014	Drafted and revised motion to extend discovery deadlines. Drafted TO declaration and proposed order.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.00	\$710.00	\$7,810.00	6/6/2014	take deposition of D Ritterbush and travel to SD

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	6/6/2014	Telephone conference with T. O'Reardon regarding deposition strategy
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	6/6/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	6/9/2014	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding due diligence sales documents and related issues.
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	6/9/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/9/2014	Assist in preparation for depositions.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	6/9/2014	prepare for deposition of Dr Stone; revise motion for extension; exchange comms with defense ocounsel about outstanding disco and review objections and responses received today
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	6/10/2014	continue preparing for Dr Stone deposition; revise motion for extension and declaration in support; call with T Carpenter about depositions and meet with GL about same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	6/10/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	6/10/2014	Motion to Extend Discovery Deadlines
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	6/10/2014	Revise motion for extension of discovery cut off.
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.75	\$335.00	\$2,931.25	6/11/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.50	\$710.00	\$7,455.00	6/11/2014	continue preparing for Stone deposition; meet with T Carpenter about Taft and Palumbo depositions; follow up with defense counsel about misc discovery issues; follow up with various retailers about subpoena responses
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	6/11/2014	Manage document production issues regarding privileged documents
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.50	\$710.00	\$8,875.00	6/12/2014	continue preparing for stone depositoin tomorrow and travel to san francisco for same

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	4.00	\$280.00	\$1,120.00	6/12/2014	Create discovery log
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	6/12/2014	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding depositions and other discovery issues; Telephone conference with A. Garganta regarding settlement
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	6/12/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/12/2014	Review joint discovery letter and email from A. Ware; Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding response.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/13/2014	Telephone conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding deposition and related matters; Follow up on upcoming depositions and outstanding discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.00	\$710.00	\$7,810.00	6/13/2014	take deposition of Dr. Stone and travel to SD
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	6/13/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	6/13/2014	Revise standstill agreement
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.75	\$960.00	\$2,640.00	6/16/2014	Review expert materials and reports; Follow up on settlement conference
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	6/17/2014	follow up with W-M counsel about subpoena; review pubmed and clinical trials for recent gluco studies and pull and review same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	6/17/2014	Plan & Prepare for mediation; Analyze science
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.25	\$710.00	\$3,017.50	6/18/2014	call with Wal-Mart counsel about subpoena; read through scientific studies and expert reports, analyze sales data, meet with T Blood and otherwise prepare for mediation tomorrow
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.50	\$960.00	\$5,280.00	6/18/2014	Plan & Prepare for settlement conference and further analyze science and 26(f) reports from other matters.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	6/19/2014	prepare for monday's settlement meeting

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.00	\$710.00	\$7,100.00	6/23/2014	travel to San Fran and have settlement meeting with defense counsel and travel to SD
Blood, Timothy	Partner	10.00	\$960.00	\$9,600.00	6/23/2014	Attend settlement meeting and travel to and from San Francisco; Telephone conference with A Levitt regarding status.
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	6/26/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/27/2014	meet with TB about disco and settlement strategy
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	6.50	\$335.00	\$2,177.50	6/27/2014	Deposition preparation for Horn
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	6/30/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	6.00	\$335.00	\$2,010.00	7/2/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	7/3/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	7/4/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	7/7/2014	review JJ's responses to fourth set of disco; follow up with co-counsel about edits to mtn to compel opposition; meet with GL about upcoming depositions and doc review for same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/7/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	7/8/2014	follow up with Target, Wal-Mart and Walgreen about subpoena productions; review and revise opposition to motion to compel and follow up with T Blood and J Siprut about same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/8/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/9/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/10/2014	follow up with Target and Wal-Mart about subpoenas; follow up with Anton about MTC and revised language

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	2.00	\$335.00	\$670.00	7/10/2014	Document review and Horn deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	5.50	\$335.00	\$1,842.50	7/11/2014	Document review
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.25	\$335.00	\$1,423.75	7/14/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	7/14/2014	exchange comms with Anton about Irvingi deposition, and comms with Thornses about upcoming depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	7/15/2014	follow up with Guido and Anton about disco issues; call with Todd C about Palumbo and meet with GL about docs for same; review potential expert qualifications and reports and follow up with TB about same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	7/15/2014	Document review and Palumbo deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	7/16/2014	Work on expert issues; Conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding same.
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	7.00	\$335.00	\$2,345.00	7/16/2014	Document review and Palumbo deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	7/16/2014	call about potential experts, review public reports, and exchange comms with potential experts; meet and prepare for next week's depositions; exchange comms with Walgreen about subpoena response
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/16/2014	Document review and Palumbo deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	7/18/2014	Document review and Palumbo deposition preparation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/21/2014	Telephone conference with expert witnesses
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/21/2014	Document review and Palumbo deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.25	\$710.00	\$4,437.50	7/21/2014	calls with T Blood and potential experts; review science studies and prepare for this week's depositions

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/22/2014	Horn deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.75	\$710.00	\$6,922.50	7/22/2014	calls with T Carpenter throughout day about Palumbo depositions and meetings with T Blood and GL about same; continue preparing for Palumbo and Horn depositions; draft and send retainers and initial materials to Silbert and Willis
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.50	\$710.00	\$7,455.00	7/23/2014	continue preparing for Horn deposition; exchange comms with Dr. Silbert; meet with T Blood about potential experts
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	2.00	\$335.00	\$670.00	7/23/2014	Pulling and preparing possible deposition exhibits
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.75	\$710.00	\$7,632.50	7/24/2014	continue preparing for tomorrow's deposition of Darcy Horn and travel to San Fran
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.00	\$335.00	\$1,340.00	7/24/2014	Document review and deposition preparation
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	7/25/2014	Document review; reading studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	13.00	\$710.00	\$9,230.00	7/25/2014	prepare for and take deposition of Darcy Horn and travel to SD
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	7/28/2014	review 2004 FDA glucosamine hearing transcripts and meet with G Laval about same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	7/28/2014	Reading glucosamine studies; FDA Report
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	7/29/2014	Document review; reviewed Joint Juice FDA documents; call with Dr. Graboff
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	7/29/2014	call with Dr. Graboff about report; call with Dr. Silbert about report; review bioavailability docs and gather same for Dr. Silbert; meet with G Laval about depo summaries
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	7/30/2014	Reviewed Joint Juice FDA documents
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	7/30/2014	pull and review studies for science experts; send comm to Dr. Graboff with materials; review 2004 FDA materials and draft and send FOIA request to FDA

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.25	\$335.00	\$2,763.75	7/31/2014	Deposition summary of Stone deposition; document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	7/31/2014	review study docs and prepare docs for Dr. Silbert
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.75	\$335.00	\$2,931.25	8/1/2014	Stone deposition summary; document review
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	7.00	\$335.00	\$2,345.00	8/4/2014	Stone deposition summary; document review
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/4/2014	Telephone conference with M. Keegan regarding background of case and expert work.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	8/4/2014	prepare for and call with M Keegan about expert report; review horn deposition and gather market research docs for Keegan; follow up with defense counsel about Palumbo deposition dates
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	8/5/2014	Horn deposition summary; document search
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	8/6/2014	Darcy Horn deposition summary; document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	8/6/2014	follow up with Dr. Silbert
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.50	\$335.00	\$2,847.50	8/7/2014	Taft deposition summary; document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.25	\$710.00	\$3,727.50	8/8/2014	pull and review science study documents for Drs. Graboff and Willis and send out same; prepare for Irving deposition
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.00	\$335.00	\$1,340.00	8/8/2014	Karina Taft deposition summary
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/8/2014	Assist in deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	8/11/2014	talk with Dr. Graboff about report and review science docs; talk with AG about scheduling
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	8/12/2014	review schedule order and proposal sent by AG, and exchange comms with TB about same; pull docs for science expert review; research case law on videotaped depositions

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	4.00	\$335.00	\$1,340.00	8/13/2014	Document review
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	8/15/2014	Telephone conference with J. Siprut, A. Levitt and T. O'Reardon regarding plaintiff deposition; Telephone conference with T. Carpenter and T. O'Reardon regarding plaintiff; Revise response to document requests.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	8/15/2014	call with co-counsel about mtn to compel hearing and strategy, and follow up call with Todd C about same; follow up about Graboff report; follow up with Keegan about report and retainer and meet with TB about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	8/18/2014	Telephone conference with Dr. Willis regarding class certification report and follow up regarding samples; Follow up on discovery responses
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	8/18/2014	call with Willis about declaration and report; call with AG about stip to extend schedule
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/20/2014	Conference and follow up on substituting plaintiff, amending complaint and depositions.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	8/20/2014	follow up with Todd C about strategy; follow up with Mark Keegan about report
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	9.00	\$335.00	\$3,015.00	8/20/2014	Document review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	8/28/2014	have call with T Donato about class cert declaration; pull marketing docs and send to TD
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	8/29/2014	review draft declaration from Willis and follow up with him and T Blood about same; call with Todd C about new clients and follow up with AG about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/2/2014	meet with BHO team about case status; call with Todd C about potential clients; exchange comms with Keegan as well as Dr. S about report status
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	9/10/2014	Maintain and update discovery log

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	9/11/2014	Maintain and update discovery log
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	9/12/2014	Telephone conference with M. Quinn regarding possible resolution
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	9/17/2014	exchange comms with defense counsel about status report due next week
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	9/24/2014	joint report regarding schedule
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	9/25/2014	call with AG and prepare status report for filing
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	9/30/2014	review scheduling order and exchange comms with Todd C about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/6/2014	exchange comms with Dr. W and Keegan about report deadline and status; review disco served today
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	10/10/2014	review JJ rogs and RFPs and follow up about providing responses
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	10/14/2014	draft responses to rogs to Sonner
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	10/15/2014	draft responses to RFPs and circulate to Todd C for input and client review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/16/2014	review draft Rog and doc request responses; review Allen v Hylands case and update class cert and substantiation research
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	10/17/2014	exchange comms about sonner disco responses with defense counsel and separately with TC
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	10/21/2014	Work on interrogatory responses; Conference and analysis with T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/21/2014	meet with TB about pltf's disco responses and revise same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/22/2014	calls with Todd C and TB about disco responses and finalize and serve same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/22/2014	Further work on discovery responses

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	10/28/2014	follow up with AG about upcoming depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	10/31/2014	call with Todd C about pltf dep and palumbo dep and follow up with AG about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	11/4/2014	review GT letter and research privilege over retainer letters and draft response to same and meet with TB about same; exchange comms with AG about depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/5/2014	follow up with opposing counsel about palumbo and irving depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	11/6/2014	revise letter regarding sonner disco responses, and exchange comms with Todd C about docs and depositions and meet with GL about depo prep
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	11/7/2014	revise letter about sonner's disco responses; review retainer sent by Todd C; send same to defense counsel; review draft report sent by Keegan ISO certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	11/10/2014	draft memo for plaintiff depo this week and gather docs to review in support and send to Todd C and have call with him about same; review sales docs for next week's palumbo dep
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	11/11/2014	prepare for palumbo dep
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	11/12/2014	prepare for palumbo and meet with GL about same; meet with Kathie S about her deposition tomorrow
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	11/13/2014	calls with Todd C about pltf dep and continue preparing for Palumbo dep
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	11/14/2014	Maintain and update discovery log
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	11/14/2014	continue preparing for palumbo dep; draft revised dep notices
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	11/17/2014	prepare for palumbo deposition next 2 days and meet with Todd C and GL throughout day about same
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$335.00	\$2,680.00	11/17/2014	Deposition preparation; document pulling

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	15.50	\$710.00	\$11,005.00	11/18/2014	travel to San Fran and attend Palumbo deposition and meet with Todd C to prepare for Palumbo deposition tomorrow
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	11/19/2014	attend palumbo deposition and travel to San Diego
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.75	\$710.00	\$4,082.50	11/24/2014	review keegan draft declaration and pull docs for same and provide proposed comments for same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	11/25/2014	review docs for Keegan and marketing declaration
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/26/2014	follow up with defense counsel about irving deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	12/1/2014	review pltf depo transcript and draft amended rog and doc request responses; follow up about Irving deposition; review Keegan declaration and docs for Keegan and in preparaton for Irving deposition on Friday; calls with Todd C about depo strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	12/2/2014	exchange comms with Todd C about amended disco responses and Stewart Irving deposition and prepare for same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.75	\$710.00	\$6,212.50	12/3/2014	prepare for Stewart Irving deposition on Friday
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	12/3/2014	Revise Willis declaration ISO class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.50	\$710.00	\$6,745.00	12/4/2014	continue preparing for irving deposition tomorrow; follow up with Keegan and Willis and meet with T Blood about declarations
Blood, Timothy	Partner	4.25	\$960.00	\$4,080.00	12/4/2014	Work on class certification motion and expert declarations
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	12/5/2014	Work on class certification expert declarations
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	12/5/2014	Maintain and update discovery log
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	12/5/2014	prepare for and travel to SF for Irving deposition, take deposition and travel to SD afterwards

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	12/8/2014	pull docs for Palumbo dep tomorrow and meet with Todd C about same; revise amended disco responses and send to Todd C for client review and respond to Guido T about same; follow up with Drs Willis and Graboff about their declarations
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	12/9/2014	Telephone conference with marketing experts regarding expert report; Follow up on various issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	12/9/2014	calls with Todd C about Palumbo dep going on today; prepare for and have call with Keegan and Donato about declaration
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	12/11/2014	call with Dr. Graboff about declaration; begin reviewing latest palumbo depo; follow up with Willis and Keegan about declaration
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	12/12/2014	follow up about Ps amended responses
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	12/15/2014	Follow up on remaining issues with marketing report
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	0.50	\$335.00	\$167.50	12/15/2014	Call with expert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	12/15/2014	calls with Donato about declaration and work on same; circulate declarations; review Ds declarations
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	12/15/2014	Telephone conference with A. Levitt and T. O'Reardon regarding expert issues and general litigation strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/17/2014	meet with Todd C about pltf disco responses and production of docs; calls with Dr. G about invoices
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	12/18/2014	work on pltfs amended disco responses and organize doc production
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/29/2014	finalize and serve amended disco responses and additional docs on defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	1/5/2015	call with Ed A about retailer subpoenas, update memo about same and circulate
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	1/6/2015	Analysis regarding defense expert report and conference with T. O'Reardon; Work on strategy with regard to issue relating to rebuttal reports and summary judgment

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/6/2015	review expert reports from Grande and Poret and meet with TB about same and draft and send comm to AG about same; exchange comms with expert about Poret report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/8/2015	review comm from AG about expert declarations and meet with TB about same; research substantiation caselaw and burdens of proof and circulate memo about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/9/2015	meet with TB about request for clarification about scheduling and begin drafting same; follow up with Dr. Willis about supplemental report and review of Grande
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	1/12/2015	draft request for clarification about supplemental expert deadline and circulate same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	1/12/2015	Telephone conference with T. Carpenter regarding expert issues and strategy.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	1/13/2015	review Grande report and have call with Dr Willis about same; review FJC reference manual and pull null hypoth materials and circulate same; follow up with AG about Poret data
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	1/14/2015	follow up with Dr. Silbert about rebuttal report
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	1/15/2015	Maintain and update discovery log
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	1/15/2015	review Poret native study data and send to Keegan; prepare for and have call with Dr. Silbert about rebuttal report; review report and send to Dr. Silbert
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.75	\$960.00	\$1,680.00	1/15/2015	Telephone conference with Dr. Silbert; Work on expert report
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	1/16/2015	Work on request for clarification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/16/2015	exchange comms with Dr. W and pull docs for his review; review request for clarification and send to defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/19/2015	meet with TB about Dr. Graboff rebuttal declaration and review materials for same

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	1/20/2015	exchange comms with Dr. Silbert and gather docs for his review and meet with GL about same; exchange comms with Dr. Willis and gather docs for his review; review Willis declaration
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	2.00	\$335.00	\$670.00	1/20/2015	Gathered studies for Expert
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	2.50	\$280.00	\$700.00	1/21/2015	Expert Report of Steven R. Graboff
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	1/21/2015	Work on expert reports
La Val, Geoffrey	Staff Attorney	3.00	\$335.00	\$1,005.00	1/21/2015	Gathering/reviewing studies for expert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/21/2015	review and revise graboff report and send him follow up about same; review edits to clarification request and follow up with Guido T about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	1/22/2015	review and revise willis declaration and send to TB; finalize request for clarification; follow up with Keegan about Poret data
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	1/23/2015	review and revise edits to Willis declaration; review Graboff declaration and follow up about same; follow up about today's order with counsel; prepare docs for Willis review
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	1/26/2015	Analysis regarding organizational recommendation against use of G-C
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.00	\$710.00	\$2,840.00	1/26/2015	exchange comms about report deadline; review scientific studies and work on proposed edits to willis report; review silbert report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.00	\$710.00	\$2,840.00	1/27/2015	continue review of declaration of willis and circulate comments to same and have call with Dr. Willis; review and provide proposed edits to Dr. Silbert's declaration; follow up with Keegan about declaration
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	1/27/2015	Analysis and meeting with Dr. Willis and T. O'Reardon regarding expert report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.75	\$710.00	\$4,082.50	1/28/2015	review and provide comments to silbert report and gather exs to same and have call with Dr. Silbert and circulate same; review

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
						and provide comments to Keegan report and circulate same; review graboff report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	1/29/2015	finalize silbert report; work on and circulate graboff report; review keegan report and call with him about same; review willis report and call with him about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/29/2015	Work on expert reports for class certification and summary judgment
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.00	\$710.00	\$3,550.00	1/30/2015	finalize willis report and send him same; review grande and poret reports from today
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/30/2015	Review and analyze defendant's supplemental expert reports.
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	2/3/2015	Retrieve third-party subpoenas and send to co-counsel
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	2/12/2015	Telephone conference with T. Norris regarding possible mediation; Follow up with T. O'Reardon regarding same; Telephone conference with A. Levitt regarding same and strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	2/13/2015	call with Dr Silbert about case status; follow up with Keegan about invoices
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/18/2015	follow up with EA about retailer subpoenas
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	2/25/2015	Conference with defense counsel regarding mediation and scheduling
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	3/2/2015	Review and revise proposed stipulation regarding mediation and scheduling
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	3/9/2015	Telephone conference with JAMS regarding various mediation details.
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	3/18/2015	Joint Motion to Continue Deadlines Relating to Class Certification
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	3/24/2015	Retrieve and organize documents to send to co-counsel regarding mediation

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	3/24/2015	Meeting with potential claim administrator regarding possible notice approaches
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	3/30/2015	drafting mediation brief
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	3/30/2015	Work on mediation brief
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	3/31/2015	Further work on mediation brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.25	\$710.00	\$4,437.50	3/31/2015	continue working on mediation brief and circulate same
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	4/1/2015	Mediation brief and exhibits
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.50	\$960.00	\$2,400.00	4/1/2015	Work on mediation brief; Conferences with T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.75	\$710.00	\$3,372.50	4/1/2015	continue working on mediation brief and meet with TB about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	4.75	\$960.00	\$4,560.00	4/2/2015	Work on mediation brief
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	4/6/2015	Prepare for mediation call; Follow up with A. Levitt and T. Carpenter; Follow up with mediator; Perform damage calculations
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	4/7/2015	Prepare for and participate in mediation strategy call; Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding additional calculations and mediation preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	4/7/2015	mediation Preparation and call about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	4/8/2015	continue working on mediation prep
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	4/8/2015	Prepare for mediation; Conference with T. O'Reardon
Blood, Timothy	Partner	13.50	\$960.00	\$12,960.00	4/9/2015	Prepare for and participate in mediation; Travel to and from Los Angeles

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	13.50	\$710.00	\$9,585.00	4/9/2015	travel to LA and attend mediation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	4/10/2015	research latest gluco studies on pubmed; follow up with experts about deposition availability
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/14/2015	work on scheduling issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	4/15/2015	work on stipulation for extension; prepare cotsco subpoena
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	4/15/2015	Review, revise and discuss proposed scheduling order
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	4/16/2015	exchange comms about cert hearing date and call with clerk about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	4/17/2015	follow up with walgreens counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/22/2015	retailer subpoenas call with EA
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/29/2015	call with W-M counsel about subpoena response, and review dec from Crisco case by W-M
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/4/2015	Follow up on scheduling issues; Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding discovery strategy
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	5/7/2015	Prepare for and participate in call with defense counsel regarding depositions
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/8/2015	Meeting regarding status and strategy
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/8/2015	Follow up on expert discovery; Review email detailing agreement
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/8/2015	review GT correspondence about expert disco; follow up with Keegan about deposition; meet with TB about case status
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/11/2015	follow up with defense counsel and Keegan about deposition; call with Costco counsel about subpoena response
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	5/12/2015	draft declaration for Costco to use in response to subpoena and circulate same; follow up with Dr. Willis about deposition

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/13/2015	follow up about walgreens subpoena
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/18/2015	Work on deposition issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/21/2015	follow up with defense counsel about scheduling expert depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/27/2015	follow up about silbert and grande depositions
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	5/28/2015	Prepare materials for depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	6/1/2015	followed up with defense counsel about keegan and poret productions; reviewed other cases involving poret
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	6/2/2015	prepare for poret deposition; follow up with A Donato about docs considered
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.75	\$710.00	\$3,372.50	6/3/2015	review poret reports and data and prepare for deposition
Menaldino, Colette	Staff Attorney	4.00	\$320.00	\$1,280.00	6/4/2015	Reading case law referencing expert Hal Poret in preparation of deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.25	\$710.00	\$3,727.50	6/4/2015	calls with Keegan about his deposition; prepare for next weeks keegan and poret depositions; circulate keegan materials to defense counsel
Maxwell, Bethany	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	6/4/2015	Chart of expert documents and bates references
Menaldino, Colette	Staff Attorney	5.00	\$320.00	\$1,600.00	6/5/2015	Reading case law referencing expert Hal Poret in preparation of deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	6/8/2015	Assist in preparation of Poret deposition and Keegan defense
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	6/8/2015	review mkt research and declarations and prepare for this week's depositions, call Keegan about same and meet with TB
Menaldino, Colette	Staff Attorney	6.00	\$320.00	\$1,920.00	6/8/2015	Reading case law referencing expert Hal Poret in preparation of deposition

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	13.00	\$710.00	\$9,230.00	6/9/2015	travel to NY for deposition and prepare for Keegan deposition tomorrow
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.75	\$710.00	\$9,052.50	6/10/2015	meet with Keegan and defend his deposition; prepare for taking deposition of Hal Poret
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	14.50	\$710.00	\$10,295.00	6/11/2015	take deposition of Hal Poret and travel to SD
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/17/2015	call with Wal-Mart inhouse about subpoena response
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.00	\$710.00	\$2,840.00	6/18/2015	coordinate with Dr. S to provide supplemental production; gather and produce Silbert docs to GT
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/22/2015	meet with TB to go over marketing depositions
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	6/22/2015	Conference regarding marketing testimony from each party's experts; Review and analyze recent case law relating to class certification issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	6/24/2015	pull docs for science depositions; follow up with Dr. Silbert about depo
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/24/2015	Follow up on discovery issues and deposition preparation.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	6/25/2015	Prepare for depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.75	\$710.00	\$3,372.50	6/25/2015	prepare for next week's grande and silbert depositions
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	6/26/2015	Further prepare for depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.25	\$710.00	\$2,307.50	6/26/2015	review Willis reports and pull docs cited and send to defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	6/28/2015	prepare for deposition of Dr. Grande this week
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.75	\$960.00	\$1,680.00	6/29/2015	Prepare for depositions; Analysis regarding need for Grande deposition; Prepare materials for Silbert preparation; Conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding same.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.25	\$710.00	\$4,437.50	6/29/2015	prepare for this week's depositions of Grande and Silbert and meet with TB about same; follow up with Dr. Willis about docs cited
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.50	\$710.00	\$7,455.00	6/30/2015	travel to Boston and prepare for Silbert deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	9.50	\$960.00	\$9,120.00	6/30/2015	Prepare and travel to Boston for expert deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.50	\$960.00	\$7,200.00	7/1/2015	Prepare for deposition of Dr. Silbert, including meeting with Dr. Silbert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	7/1/2015	prepare for Silbert deposition and meet with Dr. Silbert about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	16.00	\$710.00	\$11,360.00	7/2/2015	defend deposition of Dr. Silbert and travel to San Diego afterwards
Blood, Timothy	Partner	16.00	\$960.00	\$15,360.00	7/2/2015	Defend Silbert deposition and return from Boston
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.00	\$710.00	\$2,130.00	7/6/2015	follow up with defense counsel and Dr. W about Willis deposition; gather updated Willis CV and docs cited and produce same to defense counsel; call with Dr. G assistant and follow up with defense about deposition of Dr. G
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.75	\$710.00	\$4,082.50	7/7/2015	prepare for Dr. Willis deposition, including review scientific studies and other reports and summarize same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.25	\$710.00	\$4,437.50	7/8/2015	prepare for willis deposition; exchange comms with Dr. Willis and Dr. Silbert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.50	\$710.00	\$8,875.00	7/9/2015	travel to Indianapolis, meet with Dr. Willis and prepare for his deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	12.00	\$960.00	\$11,520.00	7/9/2015	Prepare for meeting with Dr. Willis in preparation for deposition, travel to Indianapolis and meet with Dr. Willis in preparation for deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	16.00	\$710.00	\$11,360.00	7/10/2015	defend Dr. Willis deposition and travel to San Diego
Blood, Timothy	Partner	16.00	\$960.00	\$15,360.00	7/10/2015	Defend deposition of Dr. Willis and return to San Diego

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.00	\$710.00	\$2,130.00	7/13/2015	pull and organize scientific studies and compile graboff production
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/13/2015	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding strategy and class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	7/14/2015	review silbert deposition; prepare for graboff and pull docs; follow up about retailer subpoenas
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	7/15/2015	follow up with retailers about subpoena status; follow up with co-counsel about costs and lit fund
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	7/16/2015	exchange comms about costco subpoena and moving to compel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	7/20/2015	continue reviewing silbert depositions transcript; exchange comms with GT about graboff deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.00	\$710.00	\$3,550.00	7/21/2015	Dr Graboff deposition preparation; review Willis deposition transcript
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	7/22/2015	continue reviewing gluco and chondroitin publications, including professional guidelines and preparing for Graboff deposition; call with Graboff office
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	7/22/2015	Conference regarding preparation for expert declaration and begin preparation for same.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	7/23/2015	continue preparing for graboff deposition by going through science materials and drafting memo about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	7/24/2015	gather docs for graboff meeting and continue preparation for same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	7/26/2015	finalize memo for and gather materials for graboff deposition preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	7/27/2015	travel to and from OC and meet with Dr Graboff to prepare for deposition; review science on hyal joint
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.50	\$960.00	\$7,200.00	7/27/2015	Prepare for and meet with Dr. Graboff and travel to and from Huntington Beach
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	7/28/2015	travel to Irvine and back and defend deposition of Dr. Graboff

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Menaldino, Colette	Staff Attorney	8.00	\$320.00	\$2,560.00	7/28/2015	Travel to and defend deposition of Dr. Graboff
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	7/28/2015	Multiple telephone conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding Graboff deposition and strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	7/29/2015	review 7/28 instaflex 7th circuit opinion and circulate memo about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	8/4/2015	continue reviewing willis deposition transcript and pulling and reviewing gluco studies; redline letter for walgreens to provide response to subpoena
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	8/5/2015	Review and profile Deposition of Dr. Graboff. Arrange for review by deponent for errata review.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	8/5/2015	follow up with walgreens counsel about subpoena response
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	8/7/2015	review draft declaration from Costco and exchange comms with EA about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.00	\$710.00	\$3,550.00	8/10/2015	begin working on class cert brief; meet with TB about Silbert deposition transcript and call with Dr. S about same and errata sheet
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/11/2015	Continue to follow up with counsel and Dr. Graboff regarding errata review.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.75	\$280.00	\$770.00	8/11/2015	Review, analyze, profile, update Master Matrix with hyperlinks of multiple depositions and exhibits with identification and hyperlinks.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	8/11/2015	follow up with Dr. Graboff and Dr. Willis about errata; continue reviewing docs for class cert
Menaldino, Colette	Staff Attorney	2.50	\$320.00	\$800.00	8/12/2015	Review Dr. Graboff depo for errors and possible errata sheet
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.50	\$280.00	\$1,260.00	8/12/2015	Review, analyze, profile, update Master Matrix with hyperlinks of deposition with Exs. 211- 245. with identification and hyperlinks. Update Master Matrix with identification and hyperlinks to all discovery.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	8/12/2015	fopllow up with walgreens counsel about subpoena
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	8/12/2015	Review errata to deposition of Silbert make changes to original, condensed and e-versions of depositions.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/13/2015	Continue to follow up with counsel and Dr. Graboff regarding errata review.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.75	\$960.00	\$1,680.00	8/14/2015	Review Willis deposition; Telephone conference with Dr. Willis; Follow up with T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.75	\$710.00	\$2,662.50	8/19/2015	review scientific studies and update file on same; prepare for and have conference with Dr W and TB
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/19/2015	Continue to follow up with counsel regarding Dr. Willis' errata review.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/19/2015	Telephone conference with Dr. Willis and T. O'Reardon regarding deposition review and future issues for examination
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/20/2015	Continue to follow up with counsel and Dr. Graboff regarding errata review.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	8/24/2015	Review with counsel regarding Dr. Willis' review and errata for deposition. Receive, review, profile and update hard copies of depositions with correspondence from Barkley Court Reporters regarding deposition of Mark Keegan.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/24/2015	Work on deposition issues with T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	8/24/2015	collect docs for class cert brief; review willis with TB and circulate errata
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.25	\$280.00	\$1,750.00	8/25/2015	Review, analyze and revise Master Matrix with all discovery specifics including exhibits with hyperlinks.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/26/2015	Continue to follow up with counsel and Dr. Graboff regarding errata review.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.75	\$710.00	\$2,662.50	8/26/2015	follow up about supplemental ESI; review and finalize willis errata sheet; work on class cert brief and exchange comms with GL about same

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	8/27/2015	Correspond with expert Dr. Graboff regarding review and errata for deposition. Review with counsel regarding same. Review errata changes, make errata changes in condensed and full versions of depositions as well as e-versions. Update Master Matrix.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	8/31/2015	follow up with counsel about meet and confer regarding supplemental ESI; review graboff deposition errata and circulate same; meet with GL about class cert brief and pulling exs for same
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/31/2015	Review correspondence with counsel and opposing counsel regarding Errata for Dr. Graboff's deposition.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	9/1/2015	Review hot documents and follow up on same.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	9/2/2015	call with defense counsel about supplementing ESI; meet with GL throughout day about class cert brief and docs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	9/4/2015	review and revise cert brief; analyze multistate certification case law; meet with GL about cert brief; follow up with defense counsel about Willis mtn to strike
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	9/4/2015	Review request from defense counsel regarding shortened briefing schedule; Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding same.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	9/8/2015	Telephone conference with defense counsel and T. O'Reardon regarding request for order shortening time;
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	9/8/2015	call with defense counsel about mtn to strike willis errata; research FRCP 30(e) applicability and draft memo on issue and meet with TB about same; follow up with AG about same issue
Blood, Timothy	Partner	3.00	\$960.00	\$2,880.00	9/15/2015	Work on expert report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/17/2015	exchange comms with Walgreens about subpoena response letter and edit same and circulate to counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.75	\$710.00	\$4,792.50	9/18/2015	continue drafting class cert memo and meet with TB about same

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	9/25/2015	Work on class certification motion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.25	\$710.00	\$5,857.50	9/25/2015	work on class cert brief
Blood, Timothy	Partner	3.75	\$960.00	\$3,600.00	9/26/2015	Work on class certification motion and related documents
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.25	\$960.00	\$5,040.00	9/27/2015	Work on class certification motion and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	9/28/2015	Review with team regarding filing and preparing exhibits, noting those under seal for Class Certification motion.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	9/28/2015	continue working on opening brief ISO class cert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.75	\$710.00	\$7,632.50	9/29/2015	memo ISO class certification and related exs
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.00	\$960.00	\$6,720.00	9/29/2015	Work on class certification motion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.50	\$710.00	\$8,165.00	9/30/2015	continue working on class cert brief, collecting exs and drafting declaration; exchange comms with defense counsel about productions; follow up with walmart and walgreens
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	9.00	\$280.00	\$2,520.00	9/30/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Class Certification Motion, including 70+ exhibits in both redacted and unredacted form, filing exhibits under seal and manual lodging, as well as redacted and unredacted brief. Including drafting and revising to conform with all court rules supporting papers, Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order. Additionally draft, revise and conform with all court rules Administrative Motion to file under seal, with supporting Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.50	\$960.00	\$5,280.00	9/30/2015	Work on class certification motion and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	9.50	\$280.00	\$2,660.00	10/1/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Class Certification Motion, including 70+ exhibits in both redacted

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
						and unredacted form, filing exhibits under seal and manual lodging, as well as redacted and unredacted brief. Including drafting and revising to conform with all court rules supporting papers, Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order. Additionally draft, revise and conform with all court rules Administrative Motion to file under seal, with supporting Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.75	\$710.00	\$9,052.50	10/1/2015	continue revising class cert brief and reviewing exs, revise declaration and notice of motion and motion; follow up with walmart; send walgreens materials to GT
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.50	\$960.00	\$5,280.00	10/1/2015	Work on motion for class certification and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	12.50	\$280.00	\$3,500.00	10/2/2015	Continue to review and revise to conform with all court rules Class Certification Motion, including 70+ exhibits in both redacted and unredacted form, filing exhibits under seal and manual lodging, as well as redacted and unredacted brief. Including drafting and revising to conform with all court rules supporting papers, Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order. Additionally draft, revise and conform with all court rules Administrative Motion to file under seal, with supporting Notice of Motion and Motion, Declaration and Proposed Order.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.25	\$710.00	\$5,147.50	10/2/2015	finalize class cert briefing
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	10/5/2015	Prepare the Judge's courtesy copy of conformed Class Certification Motion and Administrative Hearing and supporting documents, including 70+ exhibits in unredacted form, highlighting quoted material.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	10/5/2015	Receive, review and profile recent filings.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	10/6/2015	Receive, review and profile recent filings.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	10/6/2015	Continue to prepare the Judge's courtesy copy of conformed Class Certification Motion and Administrative Hearing and supporting documents, including 70+ exhibits in unredacted form, highlighting quoted material.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/6/2015	gather 3d party productions; call with CVS atty
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	10/8/2015	Receive, review and profile recent filings and update master matrix with hyperlink.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.75	\$710.00	\$4,792.50	10/20/2015	review Grande declarations and begin preparing mtn to strike; review pubmed for latest g and cs studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	10/21/2015	continue drafting mtn to exclude grande
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	10/22/2015	continue working on mtn to exclude grande
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	10/23/2015	Review, profile and update master matrix with descriptions and hyperlinks to K. Sonner deposition and various other documents.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	10/23/2015	Work on class certification reply and Daubert motion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.25	\$710.00	\$5,147.50	10/23/2015	continue working on mtn to exclude grande; review scientific studies
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/26/2015	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding Daubert motion to strike defendant's expert report.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	10/26/2015	continue working on memo ISO mtn to strike grande; review gluco studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.00	\$710.00	\$7,100.00	10/27/2015	continue revising mtn to exclude grande and reviewing scientific studies; follow up with Drs. willis and silbert about studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.00	\$710.00	\$7,810.00	10/28/2015	continue working on MSJ opposition and Grande brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	10/29/2015	continue working on MSJ opposition

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	10/30/2015	work on MSJ opposition and mtn to exclude grande
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.50	\$960.00	\$5,280.00	10/30/2015	Revise Daubert motion to strike Grande report
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.25	\$960.00	\$5,040.00	10/31/2015	Work on Daubert motion
Blood, Timothy	Partner	5.00	\$960.00	\$4,800.00	11/2/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and Daubert motion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	11/2/2015	work on Grande mtn to exclude and MSJ opposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	11/3/2015	Revise opposition to motion to strike Willis and Graboff testimony and deposition corrections.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.00	\$710.00	\$7,810.00	11/3/2015	continue working on MSJ opposition and Grande mtn to exclude
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	11/3/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Memorandum ISO Motion to Exclude Grande Testimony. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO Memorandum. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO Motion, Declaration and proposed order.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	11/4/2015	Continue to review and revise to conform with all court rules Memorandum ISO Motion to Exclude Grande Testimony. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO Memorandum. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO Motion, Declaration and proposed order.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.00	\$960.00	\$6,720.00	11/4/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and related documents
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.75	\$710.00	\$7,632.50	11/4/2015	continue working on MSJ opposition; Grande mtn to exclude; review Willis and Graboff oppositions; prepare stip for extension request and circulate

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	11/5/2015	work on MSJ oppo; Grande mtn to exclude; opposition to Willis and Graboff
Blood, Timothy	Partner	3.00	\$960.00	\$2,880.00	11/5/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	11/5/2015	Continue to review and revise to conform with all court rules Memorandum ISO Motion to Exclude Grande Testimony. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO Memorandum. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO Motion, Declaration and proposed order.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	11/5/2015	Review Opposition to Motion for Summary Judgment, cross reference exhibit references to determine which declarations exhibits are currently referenced.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	11/5/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Omnibus response to motion to strike errata and motions to exclude testimony. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO Response. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO of Omnibus.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	4.00	\$960.00	\$3,840.00	11/6/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	11/6/2015	Continue to review and revise to conform with all court rules Omnibus response to motion to strike errata and motions to exclude testimony. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO Response. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO of Omnibus.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.00	\$660.00	\$1,320.00	11/6/2015	edits to declaration in support of oppo to MSJ and other supporting docs
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	11/6/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Motion for Summary Judgment. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
						prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO of MSJ.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	11/7/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and related documents
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.50	\$960.00	\$2,400.00	11/8/2015	Work on MSJ opposition and related documents
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	3.50	\$660.00	\$2,310.00	11/9/2015	edits to MSJ oppo and supporting docs
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	8.00	\$280.00	\$2,240.00	11/9/2015	Review and revise to conform with all court rules Motion for Summary Judgment. Research, review, revise, redact, tab and prepare for filing conforming with all court rules all exhibits ISO. Review and revise to conform with all court rules supporting papers ISO of MSJ, including Administrative orders.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.50	\$280.00	\$1,260.00	11/10/2015	Prepare highlighted binder of all pleadings and exhibits, noting redactions in unredacted documents for The Motion for Summary Judgment and all supporting documents, Omnibus Response and all supporting documents, Motion to Exclude Grande and all supporting documents.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.75	\$710.00	\$5,502.50	12/3/2015	work on class cert reply brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.25	\$710.00	\$5,147.50	12/4/2015	continue working on class cert reply brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.75	\$710.00	\$2,662.50	12/7/2015	continue drafting class cert reply brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	12/8/2015	continue revising reply ISO class cert
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	12/9/2015	continue working on reply ISO class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.75	\$710.00	\$5,502.50	12/10/2015	continue revising class cert reply brief

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	12/10/2015	Work on reply in support of motion for class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	12/11/2015	continue working on class cert reply; draft and file mtn for page extension; review poret declaration and send analysis of same to EA
Blood, Timothy	Partner	9.00	\$960.00	\$8,640.00	12/11/2015	Work on class cert reply
Blood, Timothy	Partner	6.00	\$960.00	\$5,760.00	12/12/2015	Work on reply in support of motion for class certification and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.00	\$280.00	\$1,120.00	12/13/2015	Review and revise conforming with all court rules re Reply ISO Class Certification.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.50	\$960.00	\$2,400.00	12/13/2015	Work on reply in support of motion for class certification and related documents
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	12/14/2015	Continue to review and revise conforming with all court rules re Reply ISO Class Certification and supporting documents including, administrative Motion to file under seal, Declaration, including exhibits prepared to conform with confidentiality orders, proposed orders and Motion to exclude Poret Opinion Testimony.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	12/14/2015	continue revising and finalize class cert reply brief; revise and edit mtn to exclude poret
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	12/14/2015	Work on reply in support of motion for class certification and related documents
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	12/15/2015	review oppo to mtn to exclude grande and prepare reply ISO same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.25	\$710.00	\$2,307.50	12/16/2015	continue working on reply ISO mtn to exclude grande
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	12/17/2015	continue revising reply ISO mtn to exclude grande
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	12/18/2015	revising grande reply brief

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	12/19/2015	continue working on grande reply brief
Blood, Timothy	Partner	3.50	\$960.00	\$3,360.00	12/20/2015	Work on reply in support of motion to strike Grande
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/28/2015	review oppo to mtn to exclude poret
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	12/29/2015	work on reply ISO mtn to exclude poret
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	12/31/2015	cotinue revising reply ISO motion to exclude poret ops
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.75	\$710.00	\$2,662.50	1/2/2016	continue working on reply ISO poret motion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.25	\$710.00	\$3,017.50	1/3/2016	continue revising Poret reply and circulate same to TB
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	1/4/2016	Review and revise to conform with all court rules and prepare chamber copies for service re Reply ISO Motion to Exclude Testimony of Hal Poret.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.50	\$960.00	\$2,400.00	1/4/2016	Revise reply in support of Poret motion to strike.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	1/4/2016	finalize and file reply ISO poret motion
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.50	\$280.00	\$980.00	1/5/2016	Research, review and prepare for Hearings re: Class Certification, Summary Judgment, Excluding Expert testimony.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	1/6/2016	Research, review and prepare for Hearings re: Class Certification, Summary Judgment, Excluding Expert testimony.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	1/6/2016	review FDA GAIT docs and meet with TB about same; research DSHEA issues; draft notice of new evidence
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	1/6/2016	Conduct factual and legal research and work on notice of supplemental authority; Conferences with T. O'Reardon
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	1/7/2016	Review and revise to conform with all court Rules filing re: Supplemental authority.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	1/7/2016	Research cases and prepare for Hearings re: Class Certification, Summary Judgment, Excluding Expert testimony.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	1/11/2016	follow up with all counsel about rescheduling class cert hearing
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	1/11/2016	Follow up on scheduling issues and hearing preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/14/2016	review new evidence response and draft reply to same and meet with TB about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/15/2016	Revise reply concerning structure/function issue; Conferences with T. O'Reardon regarding same.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/18/2016	finalize and file reply ISO new evidence
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.25	\$280.00	\$350.00	1/19/2016	Research, review and prepare for Hearings re: Class Certification, Summary Judgment, Excluding Expert testimony.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.75	\$710.00	\$4,082.50	1/24/2016	review daubert motions and prepare for wed hearing
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.75	\$280.00	\$1,610.00	1/25/2016	Research, review and prepare documents for hearing, including case law.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	6.00	\$960.00	\$5,760.00	1/25/2016	Plan & Prepare for hearings on motion for summary judgment and for class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.25	\$710.00	\$7,277.50	1/25/2016	continue preparing for Wed MSJ / Daubert / Class cert hearing
Blood, Timothy	Partner	14.00	\$960.00	\$13,440.00	1/26/2016	Plan & Prepare for hearings on motions for class certification and summary judgment and travel to San Francisco
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.00	\$710.00	\$7,810.00	1/26/2016	continue preparing for MSJ/cert/daubert hearings and travel to SF for same
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	1/26/2016	Research, review and prepare documents for hearing, including case law.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	1/27/2016	attend and argue class cert / MSJ / Daubert motions and travel to SD
Blood, Timothy	Partner	12.00	\$960.00	\$11,520.00	1/27/2016	Prepare for and argue motions for class certification, summary judgment and evidentiary motions and return to San Diego

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/2/2016	follow up with Todd C about class cert hearing
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	2/22/2016	Conference regarding case status and strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	3/28/2016	review Vasic MSJ op and draft supplemental authority about same
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.25	\$280.00	\$350.00	3/29/2016	Review, revise and conform with all court rules re: Supplemental authority.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	3/29/2016	Revise notice of supplemental authority
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	3/29/2016	revise notice of supplemental authority and file same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	4/15/2016	review class cert and MSJ orders and follow up with co-counsel about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	4/18/2016	Further analysis of choice of law issues and research same; Conference with T. O'Reardon and L. Hurst regarding briefing strategy, legal arguments and related issues for further briefing.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	4/18/2016	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding defendant producing updated ESI and other discovery tasks.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	4/18/2016	meet with TB and LH about Friday's orders; review disco needs and follow up with defense counsel about same
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.50	\$810.00	\$1,215.00	4/18/2016	review file for additional briefing ordered by court on class cert
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	3.25	\$810.00	\$2,632.50	4/19/2016	research on supp briefing regarding nationwide class
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	2.50	\$810.00	\$2,025.00	4/20/2016	research of supp briefing on nationwide class
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.25	\$810.00	\$6,682.50	4/21/2016	research case law and secondary authorities; draft supplemental briefing on class cert choice of law issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	4/21/2016	research potential science experts; research latest gluco studies
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	6.00	\$810.00	\$4,860.00	4/22/2016	research and draft supplemental briefing per court order

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	4/23/2016	Conference with L. Hurst regarding supplemental brief on choice of law issue
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.00	\$810.00	\$6,480.00	4/25/2016	research and write supplemental class cert briefing
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	4/26/2016	Work on supplemental brief regarding multi-state class with L. Hurst
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.25	\$810.00	\$6,682.50	4/26/2016	research for and draft supplemental class cert briefing
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	4/26/2016	Research Legislative History for various states.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	4/27/2016	Research Legislative History for states
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.25	\$810.00	\$6,682.50	4/27/2016	research and write supplemental class cert briefing
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	6.75	\$585.00	\$3,948.75	4/28/2016	Reviewed LH draft of reply in support of motion for class certification and researched legislative history of state consumer protection statutes for damages conflicts analysis.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	3.00	\$810.00	\$2,430.00	4/28/2016	research and draft supp briefing iso class cert
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	6.75	\$585.00	\$3,948.75	4/28/2016	Reviewed LH draft of reply in support of motion for class certification and researched legislative history of state consumer protection statutes for damages conflicts analysis.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	7.25	\$810.00	\$5,872.50	4/29/2016	research and draft supp class cert briefing
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	2.00	\$585.00	\$1,170.00	4/29/2016	Researched legislative history of state consumer protection statutes for damages conflicts analysis.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.75	\$810.00	\$7,087.50	5/2/2016	research and draft supplemental class cert briefing
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	4.00	\$585.00	\$2,340.00	5/2/2016	Researched legislative history of state consumer protection statutes for damages conflicts analysis.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.00	\$710.00	\$2,840.00	5/3/2016	revise additional briefing ISO class cert; research manageability caselaw; follow up with Dr. Mc and review his articles

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	7.75	\$810.00	\$6,277.50	5/3/2016	work on supp class cert briefing
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	6.50	\$585.00	\$3,802.50	5/3/2016	Furnished researching legislative history of state consumer protection statutes for damages conflicts analysis.
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	3.00	\$585.00	\$1,755.00	5/4/2016	Final review of LH's draft of additional briefing in support of class certification.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	5/4/2016	Paralegal all main and supporting documents re: Additional Briefing ISO Motion for Class Certification.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	4.00	\$960.00	\$3,840.00	5/4/2016	Work on supplemental brief regarding choice of law and class certification
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	4.75	\$810.00	\$3,847.50	5/4/2016	work on supplemental class cert briefing
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	3.50	\$810.00	\$2,835.00	5/5/2016	work on supplemental class cert briefing
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/5/2016	follow up with AG about supplemental disco production and responses
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.75	\$280.00	\$770.00	5/5/2016	Paralegal all main and supporting documents re: Additional Briefing ISO Motion for Class Certification. Prepare for hearing.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	2.75	\$810.00	\$2,227.50	5/6/2016	final for filing supp class cert briefing
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/6/2016	help finalize supplemental class cert briefing; review Ds brief filed today
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	5/6/2016	Paralegal all main and supporting documents re: Additional Briefing ISO Motion for Class Certification.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/17/2016	follow up about Dr. McAlindon and meet with TB about supplemental ESI production
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.50	\$810.00	\$405.00	6/23/2016	read order on nationwide class certification
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/11/2016	follow up about potential class notice providers and substance of same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	7/11/2016	Work on class notice plan and motion for class notice

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	7/25/2016	follow up with KCC about notice plan
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/26/2016	review KCC proposal and call with KCC about same and meet with TB about notice plans
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	7/29/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.25	\$280.00	\$1,750.00	8/2/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	8/3/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	8/4/2016	Paralegal Reply ISO of Motion to Distribute Remaining Settlement.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.75	\$280.00	\$1,610.00	8/4/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.75	\$280.00	\$490.00	8/5/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.75	\$280.00	\$1,050.00	8/11/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	8/18/2016	review edits to status report, revise and circulate to defense counsel
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.75	\$280.00	\$770.00	8/22/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	8/25/2016	Paralegal and file Joint CMC Statement
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	8/31/2016	prepare for tomorrow's CMC and settlement meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	15.00	\$710.00	\$10,650.00	9/1/2016	travel to SF for CMC and settlement meeting, attend both and travel to SD
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	9/1/2016	settlement discussions and correspondence w/TB

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	9/1/2016	Prepare for and attend status conference in San Francisco
Blood, Timothy	Partner	12.50	\$960.00	\$12,000.00	9/1/2016	Prepare for, travel to and from and participate in settlement negotiations
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	9/2/2016	update scientific study binder and review new studies
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	9/8/2016	Update master matrix with discovery, pertinent documents, depositions, exhibits with links.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	9/8/2016	Telephone conference with T. O'Reardon regarding negotiations.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	9/9/2016	Work on demand and conferences with T. O'Reardon
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	9/26/2016	Work on discovery letter to court and conference with T. O'Reardon regarding same.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	9/26/2016	draft letter brief regarding post certification fact disco
Bass, Camille	Associate	2.00	\$410.00	\$820.00	9/27/2016	Research regarding due process rights to discovery post-certification; Emails with Attorney T. O'Reardon regarding same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	9/27/2016	revise letter brief regarding fact disco cutoff and send to AG for his portion
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	9/30/2016	review Ds opposition about addtl fact discovery, exchange comms with TB about same and edit same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/3/2016	follow up with TB and AG about hearing date for disco letter, finalize joint letter and file
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	10/19/2016	draft letter per court order meeting and conferring over supplemental discovery and have call with TB about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/20/2016	Telephone conference with A. Garganta regarding defendant's desire to further discuss settlement
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/20/2016	Telephone conference with A. Garganta regarding meet and confer for motion to compel further discovery

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/20/2016	revise letter sent yesterday about supplemental discovery meet and confer; prepare for and have meet and confer; draft and circulate stipulation concerning supplemental discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/21/2016	follow up on stipulation regarding addtl discovery, review Ds redlines, make changes to same, begin preparing letter update to Court about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/21/2016	Review and revise draft stipulation for discovery and formulate response
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	10/23/2016	Review and analyze defendant's edit to proposed stipulation, edits made by T. O'Reardon and make further edits
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	10/23/2016	Revise letter to court regarding efforts to resolve discovery dispute
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	10/24/2016	Telephone conferences and multiple follow up with defense counsel regarding discovery stipulation; Multiple revisions to discovery stipulation
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/24/2016	Telephone conference with defense counsel regarding settlement and offer; Review negotiations and strategize regarding counter demand.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/24/2016	negotiate stipulation about post march 2014 discovery, meet with TB throughou day about changes and make changes, and submit letter and stip about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	10/24/2016	Further revise discovery letter for filing with court.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	10/25/2016	follow up about ad campaign language and revise and circulate same; meet with TB about settlement offers and analysis of claims rate and notice costs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/26/2016	meet with TB about settlement counter
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	10/27/2016	follow up with tb about settlement and outstanding disco needed
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	10/27/2016	Communication with consumers and prepare matrix of findings.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	10/28/2016	Communication with consumers and prepare matrix of findings.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	10/28/2016	Paralegal Joint Motion and other related docs.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	11/1/2016	prepare long and short form notices of pendency, and follow up with KCC about banner ad notice and notice timing
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	11/2/2016	prepare motion for approval of class notice plan
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/3/2016	call with Patrick Ivie about class notice plan and review proposal for same, review banner ads
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.00	\$810.00	\$810.00	11/3/2016	calls and emails to class members who contacted us through TCA
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	11/4/2016	Research corporate structure and determine corporate status.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.75	\$810.00	\$607.50	11/4/2016	research current ownership of company for new complaints
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/4/2016	work on class notice motion
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	11/7/2016	Revise motion for approval of class notice plan and plan description; Follow up with T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/7/2016	work on class notice issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/9/2016	revise class notice plan briefing and circulate to AG for review
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/10/2016	follow up with defense counsel and KCC about class notice mtg
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/11/2016	follow up with TB and AG about class notice
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	11/16/2016	revise complaint for new cases and update science discussion for same; call with defense counsel about notice plan
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	11/17/2016	call with KCC about notice plan

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.50	\$810.00	\$405.00	11/29/2016	review and revise NY complaint
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/30/2016	follow up with defense counsel and KCC about call and meet with TB about notice plan issues
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	11/30/2016	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding class notice program and meet and confer with defense counsel
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	12/2/2016	Strategy meeting regarding experts, additional filings, status of expert reports, other information to gather and trial preparation
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.25	\$810.00	\$1,012.50	12/2/2016	atty meeting on trial preparation and strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	12/2/2016	call with defense counsel and KCC about notice plan; meet with team about experts and trial strategy; follow up with potential experts
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.00	\$660.00	\$1,320.00	12/2/2016	meeting w/counsel regarding experts and recently filed cases
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.50	\$660.00	\$1,650.00	12/5/2016	review expert reports; correspondence w/clinical expert; review scheduling for new cases;
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	12/5/2016	Paralegal Complaint (NY).
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/5/2016	review defense counsel's edits to class notices and review FJC notice checklist; call with AG about waiver and mtn to relate and send him docs for same
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	0.25	\$585.00	\$146.25	12/5/2016	Reviewed New York complaint prior to filing.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.00	\$810.00	\$810.00	12/5/2016	correspondence with NY purchaser; final for filing NY complaint
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	12/5/2016	Draft Administrative Motion for relating cases review with counsel.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	12/6/2016	correspondence w/clinical expert, discussion w/TO regarding same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	12/6/2016	Work on expert issues (damages and glucosemine)
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.75	\$810.00	\$607.50	12/6/2016	conference call with damages expert; discuss damages data and productions with TO
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	12/6/2016	discuss expert issues with LH and PB
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	12/8/2016	Paralegal Unopposed Adm. Motion and related documents and exhibits to relate cases. Review with counsel.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.50	\$810.00	\$405.00	12/8/2016	revise for filing motion to relate and transfer NY action
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.25	\$810.00	\$202.50	12/8/2016	call with potential expert;
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.75	\$660.00	\$1,815.00	12/8/2016	call w/Dr. McAlindon; drafted retainer agreement; pulled documents to send
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.50	\$810.00	\$405.00	12/13/2016	research local and federal rules on serving early discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	12/13/2016	follow up about misc issues with latest complaints
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	12/13/2016	Draft Administrative motion to relate cases and prepare supporting papers and exhibits.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	12/13/2016	Draft RFP, ROGs and Admissions.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	12/14/2016	correspondence w/McAlindon regarding report and pulled docs to send
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	12/19/2016	review studies relating to McAlindon

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.50	\$660.00	\$1,650.00	12/20/2016	pulled docs for experts; correspondence w/experts
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	12/27/2016	correspondence w/McAlindon regarding report
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.75	\$660.00	\$1,155.00	1/5/2017	correspondence w/Dr. McAlindon regarding report; review of prior expert reports
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/5/2017	call with Todd C about case status; meet with TB about settlement offers
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	1/9/2017	correspondence w/McAlindon regarding report
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	1/13/2017	Work on trial preparation
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.75	\$810.00	\$607.50	1/13/2017	talk with Tim about class notice, trial preparation, witnesses and strategy
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	1/16/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery, deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	2.50	\$810.00	\$2,025.00	1/16/2017	call with def counsel on newly filed cases and bell wether approach; discuss overall strategy with TB and TJO
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.25	\$810.00	\$1,012.50	1/17/2017	conference call with def counsel on expert exchanges and moving CMC; meet with TB on trial preparation and notice
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	1/17/2017	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with defense counsel regarding CMC and expert report issues.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	1/17/2017	Conference with L. Hurst regarding expert reports and class notice
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	2.50	\$810.00	\$2,025.00	1/20/2017	work on class notice and motion for approval of class notice
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.50	\$280.00	\$420.00	1/20/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery, deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	0.75	\$810.00	\$607.50	1/23/2017	work on revisions to notice plan with KCC and TJO
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.00	\$810.00	\$810.00	1/24/2017	research and draft Joint CMC Report
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	1/25/2017	Review filings and update captions.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	3.50	\$810.00	\$2,835.00	1/25/2017	work on mtn for approval of class notice and notice plan from KCC; draft joint case management statement in related cases
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	1/25/2017	revise class notices and circulate to defense counsel with updated plan; review and revise motion for class notice and send to defense counsel
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	1/25/2017	Review documents for pertinent produced documents.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/26/2017	review and revise draft joint CMC statement in related cases
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	1/27/2017	Revise status conference statement and follow up with defendant's regarding input
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.00	\$280.00	\$1,120.00	1/30/2017	Paralegal Motion for Approval of Class Notice and related Documents.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	3.75	\$660.00	\$2,475.00	1/31/2017	worked on expert discovery;
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	1/31/2017	Paralegal Motion for Approval of Class Notice and related Documents.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	2/1/2017	Work on expert reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	2/1/2017	Plan & Prepare for status conference and issues relating to discovery in recently filed cases
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	2/1/2017	Review filings, review with counsel, set up court call, plan and prepare for.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.50	\$660.00	\$1,650.00	2/1/2017	correspondence w/McAlindon regarding report; review of studies
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	2/2/2017	Telephone conference with Dr. McAlindon regarding expert report
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	2/3/2017	Review documents for pertinent material.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	2/6/2017	follow up with KCC about class notice program and deadlines
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	2/8/2017	Follow up on expert issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	2/9/2017	telephonic CMC; follow up with experts about status and deadlines
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	2/9/2017	Prepare for and participate in case management conference and follow up with clients
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	2/13/2017	Receive and review Expert invoice.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.00	\$280.00	\$1,120.00	2/17/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	2/17/2017	Review and prepare update information - send to plaintiffs.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	2/17/2017	correspondence w/McAlindon regarding report
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.75	\$280.00	\$210.00	2/21/2017	Review plaintiff communications, review with counsel and prepare matrix.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	2/22/2017	Review and prepare update information - send to plaintiffs.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	3/1/2017	Review and analyze notice report
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.50	\$575.00	\$862.50	3/2/2017	Developed a spreadsheet of all hot documents from document production and then analyzed to determine which documents

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
						were not in the record. Collected documents for mediation statement.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	3/3/2017	correspondence w/experts regarding reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	3/4/2017	correspondence w/expert regarding report
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	3/6/2017	calls w/experts regarding reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	4.50	\$660.00	\$2,970.00	3/7/2017	worked on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	3/8/2017	worked on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.75	\$660.00	\$1,815.00	3/14/2017	correspondence w/expert regarding report; worked on experts reports
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	3/15/2017	reviewing mcalindon report to provide comments about same; review vitamin D and mindreader documents
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	3/17/2017	Work on expert reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	3/19/2017	Work on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	3.50	\$660.00	\$2,310.00	3/19/2017	worked on expert reports
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	3/20/2017	Research and collect scholarly articles and document production for documents related to marketing.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	3/20/2017	Work on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	4.75	\$660.00	\$3,135.00	3/20/2017	worked on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	3.50	\$660.00	\$2,310.00	3/21/2017	worked on expert reports
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	3/21/2017	Searched and collected documents concerning raw data from consumer studies in the form of open-ended answers at direction of Partner.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	3/21/2017	work on expert reports
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	3/22/2017	work on and finalize opening expert merits reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.00	\$960.00	\$1,920.00	3/22/2017	Work on expert reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	5.00	\$660.00	\$3,300.00	3/22/2017	worked on expert reports
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	3/24/2017	begin review of premier science expert reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	4/3/2017	Follow up on call to A. Garganta regarding mediation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.25	\$710.00	\$3,017.50	4/3/2017	review science reports and conference with Dr McAlindon about reports and drafting rebuttal; research runhaar and rotta influence; call with TB about potential settlement and follow up with defense counsel about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/4/2017	follow up with Dr. McAlindon about science issues; meet with CS about doc review projects
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/5/2017	follow up about colin weir retention; meet with C Straub about doc review issues

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	4/7/2017	Telephone conference with C. Weir regarding expert rebuttal report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	4/7/2017	call with Colin Weier about rebuttal; review Choi report and begin drafting subpoena for underlying data
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	4/10/2017	finalize choi subpoena and follow up with defense counsel about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	4/11/2017	Telephone conference with A. Levitt regarding trial-related issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	4/25/2017	review new gluco publications and follow up with Dr McAlindon
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/4/2017	Analysis and conference with T. O'Reardon regarding further glucosamine rebuttal report
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	5/4/2017	Telephone conference with C. Weir regarding rebuttal report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	5/8/2017	call with Dr McAlindon about rebuttal report; review science and draft memo about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.50	\$575.00	\$2,012.50	5/9/2017	Review expert marketing reports and collect documents for future responses.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	5/12/2017	calls with experts about rebuttal reports; review poret report and draft memo about same; review and provide suggested edits to Dr. McAlindon's report and review science studies in connection with same
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	5/16/2017	Review document database for Expert Report possible Exhibits
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.50	\$280.00	\$700.00	5/16/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery and deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.00	\$660.00	\$1,320.00	5/16/2017	worked on expert rebuttal reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	5/17/2017	Work on expert report

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	5/17/2017	Review document database for Expert Report possible Exhibits
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.75	\$710.00	\$4,792.50	5/17/2017	work on science report and continue scientific study review; review weir report
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.25	\$660.00	\$1,485.00	5/17/2017	worked on expert rebuttal reports
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.25	\$280.00	\$1,750.00	5/17/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery and deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.25	\$660.00	\$1,485.00	5/18/2017	worked on rebuttal expert reports
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	5/18/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery and deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.75	\$710.00	\$5,502.50	5/19/2017	work on finalizing rebuttal expert reports; begin reviewing defndants rebuttal reports
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	6.00	\$660.00	\$3,960.00	5/19/2017	work on expert rebuttal reports
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	5/22/2017	Work on expert issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	5/22/2017	begin coordination for deposition of respective experts
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.75	\$660.00	\$1,815.00	5/23/2017	pulled pretrial dates and orders, met w/TB and TO regarding trial preparation; correspondence w/EC regarding trial prep
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	5/23/2017	Meeting regarding witnesses, exhibits and trial preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	5/23/2017	coordinate expert depositions; review trial deadlines; meet with team and begin going through trial Preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	5/24/2017	call with team and Doug S about trial; follow up about epxert deposition issues

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.50	\$280.00	\$1,540.00	5/24/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with discovery and deposition and exhibit descriptions and links
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/25/2017	follow up about expert discovery issues
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	5/25/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/26/2017	follow up on expert discovery and scheduling issues
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	5/26/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	5/26/2017	correspondence w/EC regarding exhibit list
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	5/30/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	5/31/2017	correspondence w/mcalindon regarding time
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	6/1/2017	Created memo at direction of partner concerning legal issues for future briefing.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	6/2/2017	correspondence w/experts regarding payment
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/6/2017	meet with TB about expert cost budget
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	6/6/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	6/7/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	6/8/2017	Plaintiff communication regarding potential depositions.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.25	\$280.00	\$1,470.00	6/8/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.75	\$280.00	\$1,610.00	6/12/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.50	\$280.00	\$1,820.00	6/13/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/14/2017	work on coordinating depositions and strategy for same
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	6/19/2017	pulled docs for depo, correspondence regarding expert depositions
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	6/20/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with deposition and exhibit descriptions and links.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	6/22/2017	Review and prepare master matrix with deposition and exhibit descriptions and links, prepare docs for exhibits for trial.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	6/22/2017	meet with TB about trial strategy; coordinate expert depositions; continue preparing for silverman deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	6/22/2017	Telephone conference with J. Grant regarding settlement offer and follow up regarding same.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	6/23/2017	Researched and wrote memo on Silverman expert reports in preparation for deposition.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	6/23/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	6/23/2017	correspondence w/EC regarding trial exhibits and review of same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	6/26/2017	Researched and wrote memo on Silverman expert reports in preparation for deposition.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	6/26/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.75	\$710.00	\$4,082.50	6/26/2017	trial Preparation and expert disco prep

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.50	\$660.00	\$1,650.00	6/26/2017	correspondence and review of trial exhibits; drafted witness list; drafted pretrial statement draft
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.50	\$710.00	\$6,035.00	6/27/2017	continue preparing for silverman deposition
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	6/27/2017	Assist in deposition preparation
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	6/27/2017	Researched and wrote memo on Silverman expert reports in preparation for deposition.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.00	\$280.00	\$840.00	6/27/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	6/28/2017	trial exhibits
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	6/28/2017	Researched and wrote memo on Silverman expert reports in preparation for deposition.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.50	\$710.00	\$7,455.00	6/28/2017	prepare for silverman deposition tomorrow
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	7.00	\$280.00	\$1,960.00	6/28/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.50	\$280.00	\$700.00	6/29/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	6/29/2017	Traveled to and from deposition of expert Dr. Silverman.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	6/29/2017	travel to LA and prepare for Silverman deposition (cancelled) and travel to SD afterwards
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.00	\$575.00	\$575.00	6/30/2017	Drafted memo concerning suppliers of glucosamine and chondroitin at direction of partner.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	6/30/2017	research discoverability of expert work papers; prepare for choi deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.00	\$710.00	\$2,840.00	7/3/2017	prepare for Choi deposition

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	7/5/2017	Drafted memo concerning suppliers of glucosamine and chondroitin at direction of partner. Wrote memo concerning deposition preparation for Dr. Choi.
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.75	\$410.00	\$307.50	7/6/2017	Discussions and emails with Leslie Hurst, Attorney T. O'Reardon, and Elle Chaseton regarding preparing witness list for trial
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	7/6/2017	correspondence regarding trial exhibits and review of same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	7/6/2017	continue preparing for Choi deposition tomorrow
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.00	\$280.00	\$1,400.00	7/6/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	7/6/2017	Drafted memo concerning suppliers of glucosamine and chondroitin at direction of partner. Wrote memo concerning deposition preparation for Dr. Choi.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.75	\$710.00	\$9,052.50	7/7/2017	prepare for and travel to SF for Choi deposition, take deposition and travel to SD afterwards
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	7/7/2017	correspondence w/TO and TB regarding deposition scheduling
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	2.50	\$280.00	\$700.00	7/7/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/10/2017	Telephone conference with T. O'Reardon regarding expert deposition strategy
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	7/10/2017	Further research jury trial issues
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	7/11/2017	Review with counsel regarding deposition summaries for trial prep.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	11.00	\$960.00	\$10,560.00	7/12/2017	Prepare for expert depositions and travel to Boston, MA

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	7/12/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.50	\$280.00	\$140.00	7/12/2017	Review with counsel regarding deposition summaries for trial prep.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.00	\$710.00	\$8,520.00	7/12/2017	travel to Los Angeles and prepare for Silverman deposition; take Silverman deposition
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.75	\$660.00	\$1,815.00	7/12/2017	trial preparation w/exhibits and narrative
Straub, Craig	Associate	12.00	\$575.00	\$6,900.00	7/12/2017	Attended deposition of expert Silverman, including travel time.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.75	\$280.00	\$1,890.00	7/13/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.50	\$710.00	\$7,455.00	7/13/2017	travel to Boston and prepare for McAlindon deposition and meet with Dr. M about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	11.00	\$960.00	\$10,560.00	7/13/2017	Prepare for expert depositions, meet with Dr. MacAlidon and return from Boston, MA
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.50	\$410.00	\$205.00	7/13/2017	Phone calls and emails with class members who could be potential witnesses
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.00	\$660.00	\$1,320.00	7/13/2017	expert depo and trial prep
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/13/2017	Summarized deposition transcripts at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/14/2017	Follow up on McAlindon deposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	17.25	\$710.00	\$12,247.50	7/14/2017	defend McAlindon deposition in Boston and travel to San Diego and begin preparing for Poret deposition
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.25	\$280.00	\$1,750.00	7/14/2017	Review and prepare potential trial exhibits with detailed list.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	7/16/2017	review scientific studies

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.75	\$280.00	\$1,050.00	7/17/2017	Review depositions, exhibits, documents, discovery and prepare for trial.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	7/17/2017	Work on trial logistics and expert issues
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/17/2017	Reviewed and wrote memo concerning European regulatory archived documents and laws at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	9.00	\$575.00	\$5,175.00	7/18/2017	Reviewed and wrote memo concerning European regulatory archived documents and laws at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	7/18/2017	Work on trial preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	14.00	\$710.00	\$9,940.00	7/18/2017	travel to New York and prepare for tomorrow's deposition of Hal Poret
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.50	\$410.00	\$205.00	7/18/2017	Phone calls and emails with class members who could be potential witnesses
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	7.00	\$280.00	\$1,960.00	7/18/2017	Summarize depositions.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.50	\$280.00	\$1,540.00	7/19/2017	Summarize depositions.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.50	\$710.00	\$6,035.00	7/19/2017	take deposition of Hal Poret; prepare for tomorrow's deposition of Colin Weir
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/21/2017	Reviewed and coded deponent documents and created deposition memo
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	7/21/2017	Work on various trial preparation tasks and expert discovery issues.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	7/21/2017	Summarize Depositions and update trial exhibits.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	8.50	\$660.00	\$5,610.00	7/21/2017	witness outlines and trial exhibits

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	7/21/2017	Review with counsel regarding trial prep. Prepare documents for co-counsel's review.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	4.50	\$660.00	\$2,970.00	7/22/2017	witness outlines and exhibits for marketing piece of trial
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.25	\$410.00	\$102.50	7/24/2017	Discuss witness list with Attorney P. Brown and Tim Blood
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	4.75	\$280.00	\$1,330.00	7/24/2017	Summarize depositions.
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	7/24/2017	Summarized deposition transcripts at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	7/24/2017	Summarized deposition transcripts at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.50	\$960.00	\$1,440.00	7/24/2017	Work on witness outlines.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	10.25	\$660.00	\$6,765.00	7/25/2017	trial Preparation
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	7/25/2017	Summarized deposition transcripts at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.25	\$410.00	\$102.50	7/25/2017	Review chart for potential absent class member witnesses
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.50	\$280.00	\$1,820.00	7/26/2017	Review new depositions that have been taken, update master matrix, trial prep, summarize depositions.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/26/2017	Created trial demonstratives for scientific evidence presentation during trial at direction of attorney P. Brown.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	6.75	\$660.00	\$4,455.00	7/26/2017	trial preparation
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	7/27/2017	Created trial demonstratives for scientific evidence presentation during trial at direction of attorney P. Brown.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	5.75	\$660.00	\$3,795.00	7/27/2017	trial Preparation
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.50	\$280.00	\$1,820.00	7/27/2017	Review new depositions that have been taken, update master matrix, trial prep, summarize depos.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	7/27/2017	Created trial demonstratives for scientific evidence presentation during trial at direction of attorney P. Brown.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.75	\$710.00	\$7,632.50	7/27/2017	prepare for tomorrow's deposition of Dr Grande
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.00	\$575.00	\$4,025.00	7/28/2017	Created memo concerning Premier's consumer research and consumer perception of Joint Juice at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	2.75	\$660.00	\$1,815.00	7/28/2017	trial preparation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	12.75	\$710.00	\$9,052.50	7/28/2017	travel back and forth from SD to SF and take deposition of Dr. Grande; update memo on potential trial defenses
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	7.50	\$280.00	\$2,100.00	7/28/2017	Review new depositions that have been taken, update master matrix, trial prep, summarize depos.
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.75	\$410.00	\$307.50	7/31/2017	Meeting with Tim Blood, Attorney T. O'Reardon, Attorney P. Brown, and Craig Straub regarding presentation tomorrow
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	9.50	\$660.00	\$6,270.00	7/31/2017	trial preparation
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/31/2017	Created memo concerning Premier's consumer research and consumer perception of Joint Juice at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	7/31/2017	meet with team about strategy and work on science presentation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.00	\$710.00	\$7,100.00	8/1/2017	meet with team and go through trial strategy with Craig Peters

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	10.00	\$660.00	\$6,600.00	8/1/2017	trial preparation meeting
Blood, Timothy	Partner	6.00	\$960.00	\$5,760.00	8/1/2017	Prepare for and participate in trial planning meeting with team and C. Peters
Straub, Craig	Associate	10.00	\$575.00	\$5,750.00	8/1/2017	Attended meeting with co-counsel concerning trial preparation.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.75	\$280.00	\$1,610.00	8/1/2017	Review new depositions that have been taken, update master matrix, trial prep, summarize depositions.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.75	\$280.00	\$1,890.00	8/2/2017	Review depositions, exhibits, trial prep, summarize depositions.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	8/2/2017	work on study charts and review scientific studies
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/2/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation.
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.00	\$575.00	\$575.00	8/3/2017	Call with expert concerning newly published study. Researched and wrote email to partner T. O'Reardon concerning case law on submitting an updated expert report.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.50	\$280.00	\$980.00	8/3/2017	Review new depositions that have been taken, update master matrix, trial prep, summarize depositions.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	8/3/2017	review science and continue working on charts and memo about same; call with Dr McAlindon about studies; review Grande transcripts; review Dr. McAlindon transcript
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.25	\$575.00	\$4,168.75	8/3/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.00	\$280.00	\$1,680.00	8/4/2017	Review depositions , exhibits, trial prep, summarize depositions.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/4/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	8/7/2017	meet with TB and PB throughout day about trial strategy and work on stipulations of facts and law; coordinate expert meeting for Boston

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.00	\$710.00	\$5,680.00	8/8/2017	work on advertising timeline, narrowing of factual issues and jury instructions
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/8/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation. Searched database for documents that may be used at trial concerning chondroitin and taste.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.75	\$575.00	\$5,031.25	8/9/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation. Searched database for documents that may be used at trial concerning chondroitin and taste.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	3.75	\$280.00	\$1,050.00	8/10/2017	Trial preparation.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/10/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation. Searched database for documents that may be used at trial concerning chondroitin and taste.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/11/2017	Created spreadsheet of a clinical studies for use in trial preparation. Searched database for documents that may be used at trial concerning chondroitin and taste.
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	8/14/2017	Searched and collected packaging exmplars to be used at trial.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	8/15/2017	Searched and collected packaging exemplars to be used at trial. Searched and collected marketing materials to be used as trial exhibits.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	8/16/2017	Searched and collected packaging exemplars to be used at trial. Searched and collected marketing materials to be used as trial exhibits. Created timeline of events for trial preparation. Drafted and sent Freedom of Information Act request concerning the GAIT Study. Researched background information on the GAIT study. All at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	11.50	\$710.00	\$8,165.00	8/16/2017	travel to Boston and prepare for expert meetings tomorrow and meet with TB and CP to discuss trial strategy
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.25	\$410.00	\$102.50	8/16/2017	Emails with Tim Blood and Attorney T. O'Reardon regarding research on false, preexisting beliefs of class members

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	12.50	\$960.00	\$12,000.00	8/16/2017	Prepare for meetings with expert and meet with co-counsel and travel to Boston
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	5.25	\$280.00	\$1,470.00	8/16/2017	Trial prep, summarize depositions.
Bass, Camille	Associate	0.25	\$410.00	\$102.50	8/17/2017	Emails with Tim Blood, Attorney T. O'Reardon, and discussion with Attorney P. Brown regarding research on false, preexisting beliefs of class members
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	16.00	\$710.00	\$11,360.00	8/17/2017	meet with experts in Boston and travel to SD and review scientific literature
Bass, Camille	Associate	3.25	\$410.00	\$1,332.50	8/17/2017	Research on false, preexisting beliefs of class members
Blood, Timothy	Partner	15.00	\$960.00	\$14,400.00	8/17/2017	Prepare for and meet with experts for trial prep, call with CFPB attorney and return to San Diego
Bass, Camille	Associate	2.75	\$410.00	\$1,127.50	8/17/2017	Draft memo regarding research on false, preexisting beliefs of class members
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	6.50	\$280.00	\$1,820.00	8/17/2017	Trial preparation.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	8/25/2017	Telephone conference with Dr. McAlindon and co-counsel regarding trial testimony and demonstratives
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.50	\$710.00	\$5,325.00	8/28/2017	review science studies and work on demonstratives and charts of same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	8/29/2017	Created spreadsheet concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.00	\$710.00	\$3,550.00	8/30/2017	work on science study demonstratives and review
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/30/2017	Created spreadsheet concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	8/31/2017	Created spreadsheet concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	9/1/2017	continue going through science studies and updating demonstratives and coordinate with Dr McAlindon about analysis
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	9/1/2017	Created spreadsheet concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon. Created memo concerning study comments on the differences between glucosamine HCL and sulfate formulations.
Chaseton, Michelle	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	9/1/2017	Prepare correspondence update to plaintiffs regarding trial being continued.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	9/5/2017	Created spreadsheet concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon. Created memo concerning study comments on the differences between glucosamine HCL and sulfate formulations.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	9/6/2017	Created trial demonstratives concerning Premier's marketing of Joint Juice.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	9/7/2017	Created trial demonstratives concerning Premier's marketing of Joint Juice.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	9/8/2017	Created trial demonstratives concerning Premier's marketing of Joint Juice.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	9/12/2017	Created trial demonstratives concerning Premier's marketing of Joint Juice.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/13/2017	meet with Craig S about revised demonstratives; review Reginster publications and follow up with Dr. M about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	9/19/2017	meet with CS about slides and studies; review scientific studies and follow up with team and Dr M about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	9/19/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	9/20/2017	meet with CS throughout day about scientific studies and work on demonstratives

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	9/20/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	9/21/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	9/21/2017	meet with Craig S about mcalindon and scientific studies and graphics, have call with Dr M about same and meet with TB about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	9/22/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	9/25/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	9/28/2017	meet with Craig S about demonstratives and follow up with experts and consultant about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	9/29/2017	Call with expert Dr. McAlindon regarding trial demnstratives.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	9/29/2017	calls with Dr M and Morgan S about demonstratives and studies; meet with CS throughout day about studies
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	9/29/2017	Call with litigation demonstrative contractor regarding trial demonstratives.
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.00	\$575.00	\$4,025.00	9/29/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.25	\$575.00	\$4,743.75	10/2/2017	Wrote memo concerning minimum clinical importance and entered data from relevant clinical studies at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/3/2017	meet with TB and Craig P to discuss expert strategy and demonstratives

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	10/3/2017	Wrote memo concerning minimum clinical importance and entered data from relevant clinical studies at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/4/2017	Created a detailed spreadsheet concerning minimum clinical importance for all clinical studies to be used as trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.75	\$575.00	\$5,031.25	10/5/2017	Wrote memo concerning minimum clinical importance and entered data from relevant clinical studies at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/6/2017	conference with Dr. M about meta-analyses and demonstratives, and follow up with team about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/6/2017	Created a detailed spreadsheet concerning minimum clinical importance for all clinical studies to be used as trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/9/2017	Created a detailed spreadsheet concerning minimum clinical importance for all clinical studies to be used as trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/10/2017	Created timeline of events and a memo concerning the public comments and prior testimony mentioning experts for trial preparation at direction of attorney P. Brown.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/11/2017	Created a detailed spreadsheet concerning minimum clinical importance for all clinical studies to be used as trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/12/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/12/2017	meet with Craig S about studies and demonstratives
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/13/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/16/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/17/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	10/18/2017	Created spreadsheet and PowerPoint concerning the details of relevant clinical studies for use in trial demonstratives at direction of partner T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	10/19/2017	Created spreadsheet of primary and secondary study endpoints with corresponding placebo rates for use as a trial demonstrative.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	10/23/2017	review scientific studies including new Liu meta and meet with Craig S about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	10/24/2017	review FDA-related GAIT docs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	10/25/2017	review scientific studies and meet with Craig S about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.75	\$575.00	\$4,456.25	10/25/2017	Reviewed and wrote memo describing National Institute of Health GAIT documents to possibly be used at trial by our experts.
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	10/26/2017	Reviewed and wrote memo describing National Institute of Health GAIT documents to possibly be used at trial by our experts.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	10/30/2017	review mcalindon studies and meet about and critique same
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	10/31/2017	Created spreadsheet of primary and secondary study endpoints with corresponding placebo rates for use as a trial demonstrative.
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	11/3/2017	Conference call with expert T. McAlindon regarding trial preparation.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.50	\$575.00	\$4,312.50	11/3/2017	Created spreadsheet of primary and secondary study endpoints with corresponding placebo rates for use as a trial demonstrative.
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	11/6/2017	Read D. Grande expert opinions and create additional PowerPoint slides to be used at trial or provided to co-counsel for trial strategy.
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	11/7/2017	Read D. Grande expert opinions and create additional PowerPoint slides to be used at trial or provided to co-counsel for trial strategy.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	11/8/2017	meet with Craig S and prepare for Dr M meeting today; have meeting with Dr M about scientific studies and demonstratives
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.00	\$575.00	\$4,025.00	11/8/2017	Prepared notes, presentation and questions for meeting with expert T. McAlindon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.00	\$575.00	\$4,025.00	11/8/2017	In-person meeting with expert T. McAlindon.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	11/8/2017	Meet with Dr. McAlindon
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	11/9/2017	Reviewed and wrote memo regarding an FDA review at direction of attorney T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	11/9/2017	meet with Craig S and review studies; follow up with Dr. M about study docs
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	11/14/2017	Analyzed multiple studies to determine if they should be presented at trial.
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	11/28/2017	Analyzed studies published by our expert Dr. McAlindon. Discussed results with attorney T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/29/2017	meet with Craig S and review G/C studies
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	11/29/2017	Reviewed all new studies and reports on glucosamine and chondroitin and wrote memo concerning findings.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.00	\$710.00	\$2,130.00	11/30/2017	meet with CS about scientific studies; review 2017 studies

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	11/30/2017	Reviewed all new studies and reports on glucosamine and chondroitin and wrote memo concerning findings.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	12/1/2017	Reviewed all new studies and reports on glucosamine and chondroitin and wrote memo concerning findings.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.00	\$710.00	\$4,260.00	12/11/2017	review G/C analyses and work with Craig S on demonstratives; draft status report to submit on thursday; follow up with experts about trial availability
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	12/12/2017	Discussed and analyzed expert Dr. McAlindon's potential demonstratives for trial.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	12/15/2017	Analyzed studies published by our expert Dr. McAlindon. Discussed results with attorney T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	12/18/2017	Analyzed studies published by our expert Dr. McAlindon. Discussed results with attorney T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	4.50	\$710.00	\$3,195.00	12/19/2017	research government opinions on G/C and meet with CS about NHS England materials; follow up with Dr. M about recenty G/C publications and NHS England report; review Prevagen class cert and MSJ opinions; review Judge Seeborg's lumber liquidators opinion
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	12/19/2017	Analyzed studies done by our expert Dr. McAlindon. Discussed results with attorney T. O'Reardon.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	12/20/2017	review published journal comments identified by CS and follow up about supplemental report
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	12/29/2017	follow up on G/C industry influence factual research and investigation
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	1/2/2018	investigate industry influence and regulatory oversight on studies
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	1/3/2018	Attended conference call with co-counsel concerning trial strategy. Prepared for trial preparation meeting to be held January 17, 2018.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/3/2018	Work on demonstratives and expert presentation issues with co-counsel

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	1/3/2018	meet with team and go over science and demonstratives and work on same
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.75	\$575.00	\$1,581.25	1/4/2018	Prepared for trial preparation meeting to be held January 17, 2018.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.75	\$575.00	\$1,581.25	1/9/2018	Prepared for trial preparation meeting to be held January 17, 2018.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/9/2018	meet with Craig S about science demonstratives and studies and work on same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.50	\$710.00	\$1,775.00	1/10/2018	review and analyze mcalindon opinions and summarize same and work on science graphics with Craig S
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	1/10/2018	Prepared for trial preparation meeting to be held January 17, 2018.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/11/2018	meet with TB and CS about trial preparation and strategy
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	1/11/2018	Prepared for trial preparation meeting to be held January 17, 2018.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	1/15/2018	continue working on science demonstratives and reviewing studies; revise memo about mcalindon pooled analysis; meet with CS about studies; prepare for wednesdays trial preparation meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	1/16/2018	review scientific studies and evidence and marketing studies and update slide and go through presentations with CS before tomorrow's meeting
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.00	\$960.00	\$6,720.00	1/17/2018	Prepare for and participate in trial preparation meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	9.00	\$710.00	\$6,390.00	1/17/2018	meeting at BHO with CP, TB and CS about science and demonstratives and trial strategy; call with Dr M about science issues
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.75	\$575.00	\$5,031.25	1/17/2018	All day trial preparation meeting with Craig Peters.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	1/18/2018	meet with CS about demonstratives, review and revise memo about trial meeting yesterday

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	1/19/2018	Created and edited draft trial preparation demonstratives including a comprehensive table indicating risk of bias for multiple studies.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/22/2018	meet with CS about poret survey and science demonstratives, and revise same
Straub, Craig	Associate	3.00	\$575.00	\$1,725.00	1/22/2018	Created and edited draft trial preparation demonstratives including a comprehensive table indicating risk of bias for multiple studies.
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.25	\$575.00	\$3,593.75	1/23/2018	Created and edited draft trial preparation demonstratives including a comprehensive table indicating risk of bias for multiple studies.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	1/30/2018	review filings about Dr. Theo and Clegg; follow up about Dr McAlindon opinons
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.25	\$960.00	\$1,200.00	7/10/2018	Work on CMC statement
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/10/2018	Work on document requests
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	7/11/2018	Drafted discovery requests.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	7/12/2018	Further work on CMC statement, review edits from defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.50	\$710.00	\$5,325.00	7/12/2018	revise and finalize cmc statement and calls with Brian F about same; finalize and service first sets of disco for the related actions
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	7/12/2018	Drafted discovery requests.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.50	\$960.00	\$2,400.00	7/18/2018	Plan & Prepare for status conference and travel to San Francisco
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.00	\$960.00	\$6,720.00	7/19/2018	Prepare for status conference, meet C. Peters for preparation, attend status conference and return to San Diego.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/19/2018	conference with TB and PB about today's CMC and follow up items; draft memo about to do items

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	7/24/2018	Work on scheduling plan and research MDL guidance regarding same.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	7/30/2018	follow up about potential CMC dates; follow up with Dr. McAlindon about studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	8/7/2018	research international regulatory decisions about glucosamine
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	8/22/2018	Work on status conference statement
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	8/28/2018	work on case management statement and send draft of same to defense counsel
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	9/5/2018	Conference regarding strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/5/2018	meet with TB and CS to discuss status and strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	9/5/2018	draft stipulation related to use of mullins documents in related actions; review sales data to determine what to seek from 3d parties in related actions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	9/6/2018	revise stipulation on Mullins Discovery and send to defense counsel; draft protective order for related actions and circulate same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	9/12/2018	Work on CMC statement and respond to defendant's positions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	9/12/2018	review Ds edits to CMC statement and revise same; research MDL and Manual case law about order of trying cases and class cert proceedings
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.00	\$710.00	\$2,130.00	9/13/2018	work on protective order, mullins disco stip, and CMC statement throughout day including conferences with TB and BF about same, and finalize and file same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	9/18/2018	Investigate potential witness
Blood, Timothy	Partner	2.75	\$960.00	\$2,640.00	9/19/2018	Plan & Prepare for status conference, including meeting with C. Peters and travel to San Francisco

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	9/20/2018	follow up with TB about today's status conference and plaintiff coordination issues; review Ds RFPs sent today
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	9/20/2018	Calendar CMC and discovery cut-off dates
Blood, Timothy	Partner	7.00	\$960.00	\$6,720.00	9/20/2018	Prepare for and attend status conference, conference with C. Peters regarding outcome and ongoing strategy and return to San Diego
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	9/21/2018	Work on plaintiffs' responses to defendant's request for production of documents, including conference with P. Brown and information gathering.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/21/2018	review RFPs and meet with JK and CS about same; begin compiling plaintiff analysis
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	9/24/2018	Participate in strategy call
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.75	\$575.00	\$431.25	9/24/2018	Calls with joint juice purchasers
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	9/24/2018	meeting w/co-counsel concerning experts and discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	9/25/2018	call with Brian F about ESI plan and meet with CS about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.75	\$575.00	\$1,581.25	9/25/2018	Created sample science demonstratives for focus group.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.75	\$575.00	\$1,581.25	9/27/2018	Wrote memo to defense counsel concerning discovery meet and confer meeting.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	9/28/2018	Prepare for and call with Dr M about science strategy
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	9/28/2018	Telephone conference with co-counsel and Dr. MacAlindon regarding expert issues, updating science review and related issues and follow up

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	10/1/2018	telephone conference with co-counsel regarding experts and plaintiff discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/1/2018	review G and C studies
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/1/2018	Conference with P. Brown regarding discovery and expert issues
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	10/2/2018	Work on ESI plan
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	10/2/2018	work on ESI plan and related brief
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	10/3/2018	research ESI law and protocols; review latest scientific studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	10/5/2018	review G and C studies and follow up with Dr. M and co-counsel about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	10/9/2018	Call with defense counsel concerning discovery ESI matters.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/9/2018	meet and confer about ESI and review terms proposed by Brian F and follow up with CS about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/10/2018	draft status report concerning ESI plan and follow up with defense counsel about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/11/2018	work on proposed ESI plan and meet and confer with Brian F about same; compare proposals; finalize and file ESI plan
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	10/15/2018	Conference regarding discovery responses, expert witness issues and state court strategy
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	10/15/2018	co-counsel strategy call; prepare top class action advertisement and circulate same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/16/2018	review keywords and send revisions of same to brian f
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	10/16/2018	edits to plaintiff discovery responses

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	1.00	\$280.00	\$280.00	10/18/2018	Create plaintiff discovery log
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	10/22/2018	review Ps draf RF P responses and edit same and meet with Craig and PB about same; coordinate top alss action advertisement
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	10/22/2018	correspondence w/defense counsel regarding plaintiff discovery responses
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.25	\$575.00	\$1,293.75	10/22/2018	Wrote case law memo concerning medical privacy rights and discovery of attorney retainer agreement at direction of attorney T. O'Reardon
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.75	\$575.00	\$3,306.25	10/23/2018	Wrote case law memo concerning medical privacy rights and discovery of attorney retainer agreement at direction of attorney T. O'Reardon
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	10/24/2018	Work on TCA piece
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	10/24/2018	Wrote case law memo concerning medical privacy rights and discovery of attorney retainer agreement at direction of attorney T. O'Reardon
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	10/29/2018	investigate potential pltfs and follow up with Craig S about same
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	2.00	\$280.00	\$560.00	10/29/2018	Review plaintiffs' discovery responses and finalize production for service
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	10/31/2018	review information from potential clients and follow up with CS about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/1/2018	follow up with CS about potential clients
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	11/2/2018	review potential client info and send along same to CS
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	12/19/2018	Follow up on various issues

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	12/19/2018	correspondence w/co-counsel regarding strategy meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	12/19/2018	research latest science on GC
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	12/19/2018	print trial exhibit list and witness list for team meeting
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	12/20/2018	Created trial demonstratives to be used at trial prep meeting with Craig Peters.
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	1/2/2019	Prepare trial materials for trial preparation meeting
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	1/2/2019	Follow up on preparation for all hands meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	1/2/2019	prepare for fridays trial strategy meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	1/3/2019	prepare for tomorrow's strategy meeting; follow up with Brian F about ESI status
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.25	\$575.00	\$143.75	1/3/2019	Prepared for Joint Juice trial prep meeting including printouts and computer setup.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	1/3/2019	drafted agenda for trial preparation meeting
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.50	\$710.00	\$6,035.00	1/4/2019	in-person meeting with team to go through case strategy and demonstratives; review new Rovati meta; work on defendants focus group arguments
Blood, Timothy	Partner	6.00	\$960.00	\$5,760.00	1/4/2019	Participate in trial preparation and case strategy all hands meeting.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/4/2019	Work on verdict form for focus group.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	6.50	\$660.00	\$4,290.00	1/4/2019	trial Preparation and strategy meeting w/CP

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	1/7/2019	continue preparing for focus groups and outline of defs arguments; follow up with Brian F about disco M&C
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/8/2019	meet and confer with Brian F about disco status and meet with TB about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	1/11/2019	Wrote Requests for Admission for Bland v. Premier and Federal Related Actions including time spent reading deposition transcripts and previous discovery responses in all Joint Juice related cases
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	1/15/2019	review defs latest production and follow up with CS and defense counsel about same
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	1/15/2019	Reviewed and coded document production and collected documents.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.50	\$710.00	\$2,485.00	1/18/2019	review portions of latest doc production
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/21/2019	work on science issues iso class certification
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	1/22/2019	Follow up on service and discovery issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/22/2019	review Defs rog responses; follow up with Brian F about disco status; meet with PB about disco and depo dates
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	1/24/2019	Wrote RFA's, ROG's and RFA's for federal related cases.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	1/25/2019	Created demonstratives for focus group in preparation for trial.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	1/25/2019	Prepare for, participate in and follow up on telephone conference with C. Bauss
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.00	\$575.00	\$575.00	1/25/2019	Call with Carol Bauss regarding focus group preparation and issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	1/28/2019	prepare for tomorrows meet and confer with Angel G about disco responses and other misc disco issues
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.75	\$575.00	\$431.25	1/29/2019	Call with defense counsel concerning discovery responses

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.00	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	1/29/2019	review rog responses and sales exs and have meet and confer with Angel G about same; meet with TB about disco status; revise notice of related cases
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/5/2019	follow up about pltfs depositions and coordinating same
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.00	\$575.00	\$575.00	2/6/2019	Created demonstratives for focus group in preparation for trial.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.75	\$710.00	\$1,952.50	2/7/2019	review new ESI production and follow up with defense counsel about clarity issues and with vendor about parent child issues; revise 30b6 notice; conduct research on roles of persons listed in disclosures and rog responses
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	2/11/2019	revise 30b6 notice and circulate; review individual wit docs and proposed trial exs and analyze potential depositions; review Farar v. Bayer filings
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	2/11/2019	Work on 30(b)(2) and (6) deposition issues
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.50	\$575.00	\$1,437.50	2/11/2019	Created demonstratives for focus group in preparation for trial.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.25	\$710.00	\$5,857.50	2/12/2019	continue reviewing potential trial exs for authenticity and potential deposition issues
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	2/12/2019	correspondence w/plaintiffs regarding depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	6.50	\$710.00	\$4,615.00	2/13/2019	follow up with AG about pltfs depositions; meet with TB about 30b6 notice, revise same and serve same; review new ESI and follow up with vendor about database structure issues
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.75	\$960.00	\$720.00	2/13/2019	Work on 30(b)(6) deposition notice and analysis of discovery remaining to be completed.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/14/2019	review database and follow up with vendor about issues with same; coordinate about pltfs depositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	3.25	\$710.00	\$2,307.50	2/15/2019	prepare and serve subpoenas for testimony and documents on walmart, sams, costco, walgreens, rite aid, cvs, target and

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
						groger; follow up with AG about disco status and pltfs depositions dates
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	2/21/2019	Follow up on jury focus group issues.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	2/22/2019	meet about Bayer trial and focus groups; revise stip to extend deadlines and send same to defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	2/22/2019	follow up with costco, walmart, cvs and walgreens about subpoenas
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.50	\$960.00	\$480.00	2/22/2019	Telephone conference with C. Peters, C. Straub and P. Brown regarding focus group strategy and trial theme and evidence development
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	2/22/2019	Call with Craig Peters regarding focus group in preparation for trial.
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	3/6/2019	Update discovery log
Maytorena, Dafne	Paralegal	0.25	\$280.00	\$70.00	3/7/2019	Save responses and objections by Rite Aid, Target and CVS to document subpoena and update discovery log
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	3/12/2019	meet and confer with Rite Aid counsel about subpoena; follow up with CVS counsel about subpoena
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.25	\$575.00	\$143.75	3/12/2019	Call with Kate Mullen regarding Rite Aid subpoena
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.25	\$575.00	\$143.75	3/14/2019	Call with CVS counsel concerning subpoena.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	3/14/2019	meet and confer with CVS counsel; draft sales data and customer info declarations and send to counsel for CVS and Rite Aid
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	3/20/2019	correspondence w/plaintiff Fishon regarding depo
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	3/28/2019	meet and confer with Amit Rama and CS about mis disco issues

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Blood, Timothy	Partner	1.00	\$960.00	\$960.00	3/28/2019	Work on motion for leave to take jurisdictional discovery
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	3/29/2019	call with Walgreens about subpoena responses and objections
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	4/5/2019	meet and confer with amit R about ESI status
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	5.50	\$710.00	\$3,905.00	4/23/2019	review 2k docs from latest ESI production
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.50	\$575.00	\$1,437.50	4/23/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	4/24/2019	review additional documents from Premier's latest ESI production and update memo about same; follow up with defense counsel about meet and confer for Friday
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	4/24/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	4/26/2019	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding defendant's request to expedite responses to medical issue discovery.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.25	\$710.00	\$887.50	4/26/2019	call with AG, AR, Attorney P. Brown and CS about misc disco issues; revise and send defense counsel the stips to substitute in michigan and massachusetts; meet with TB about strategy and med records.
Straub, Craig	Associate	0.50	\$575.00	\$287.50	4/26/2019	Call with opposing counsel regarding discovery disputes.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	4/27/2019	follow up about issues with defs latest esi production
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	4/30/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial.

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	1.00	\$575.00	\$575.00	5/1/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/3/2019	follow up with ESI vendor about latest production and database issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/6/2019	follow up with PB about pltf's med records disco responses; follow up with vendor about ESI replacement images from defense counsel
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	5/8/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	5/9/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	5/10/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions and possibly trial
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	5/16/2019	review and revise responses to medical Rogs and RFPs and meet with PB about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	5/17/2019	help finalize pltf's disco responses;
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	5/17/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.00	\$575.00	\$4,025.00	5/20/2019	Searched and collected documents for class certification brief and 30(b)(6) depositions.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	5/28/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial.
Straub, Craig	Associate	2.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	5/29/2019	Updated science demonstratives

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/10/2019	meet with CS about disco stastus and strategy
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	6/10/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial; updated draft trial exhibit list
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.25	\$660.00	\$165.00	6/10/2019	correspondence w/plaintiffs regarding despositions
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	6/11/2019	meet with CS about disco strategy and retailer subpoenas; follow up with Costco counsel about subpoena
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.50	\$575.00	\$4,887.50	6/11/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial.
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.50	\$575.00	\$3,162.50	6/12/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial; updated draft trial exhibit list
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	6/13/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial; updated draft trial exhibit list
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	6/13/2019	follow up with counsel for costco, walmart, rite aid, cvs, walgreens, kroger and target about subpoena responses
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/14/2019	call with Costco counsel about subpoenas
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	6/14/2019	Searched and wrote memo concerning possible EMA experts at request of attorney T. O'Reardon.
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	6/21/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial; updated draft trial exhibit list

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	6/24/2019	Searched, coded, annotated, and collected hot documents and documents specific to certain issues which are anticipated to be used in future motions, depositions, and possibly trial; updated draft trial exhibit list
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/24/2019	follow up with defense counsel about Premier's disco responses and respond to Amit R email about same
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	6/26/2019	Conference with T. O'Reardon regarding defendant's request for continuance of discovery deadline and delay in motion filings.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	6/26/2019	prepare for and have call with defense counsel about disco issues and scheduling, and meet with TB about same
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	6/27/2019	follow up with Angel G about scheduling issues
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	6/28/2019	review supplemental RFP responses about UPC codes; follow up with Costco, Walmart and Target about subpoenas and status
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.25	\$710.00	\$177.50	7/1/2019	follow up with walmart counsel about subpoena response and follow up with Angel about meet and confer over scheduling
Blood, Timothy	Partner	0.25	\$960.00	\$240.00	7/2/2019	Follow up on scheduling issues and discovery of plaintiffs
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	7/2/2019	call with Angel G about scheduling relating to MSJ, class cert, depositions and fact cutoff and meet with TB about same; meet with PB about class cert briefing
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	2.25	\$710.00	\$1,597.50	7/3/2019	research latest casse law on adequate remedy issue; calls with Walmart about subpoena responses and exchange follow up comms about same; call with Costco counsel about subpoena response
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/9/2019	review and revise proposed stipulation for continuance of fact disco deadline and sent same to TB for review and then defense counsel
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	7/10/2019	call with AG and AR about extension stipulation and meet with CS about same; begin coordinating pltf's deposition dates with PB

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/12/2019	call with Amit R about extension stip and review and redline same
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/15/2019	Time spent writing Class Certification motion including time spent finding case law.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/16/2019	follow up with amit R about extension stip being filed today; follow up with Walgreens counsel about subpoena response and data produced
Straub, Craig	Associate	5.00	\$575.00	\$2,875.00	7/16/2019	Time spent writing Class Certification motion including time spent finding case law.
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.00	\$660.00	\$660.00	7/16/2019	correspondence w/plaintiffs regarding depositions
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	7/17/2019	Time spent writing Class Certification motion including time spent finding case law.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/17/2019	meet with PB about pltf depo dates and follow up with Amit R about same; follow up with Craig S about addtl discovery concerning purity levels
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	7/17/2019	correspondence w/plaintiffs regarding depositions
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.75	\$810.00	\$1,417.50	7/18/2019	draft rule 28j letter; read recent case law for letter
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	1.25	\$810.00	\$1,012.50	7/18/2019	read def's motion for judgment on the pleadings; discuss with TJO; research for opposition
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.00	\$710.00	\$710.00	7/18/2019	begin looking at mtn for judgment pleadings filed today by premier and meet with LH and CS about evidence for same; follow up with defense counsel about pltf depositions; follow up with walmart counsel about subpoena response
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	7/18/2019	correspondence regarding plaintiff depositions

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.00	\$810.00	\$6,480.00	7/19/2019	research and draft opposition to motion for judgment on the pleadings
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.75	\$710.00	\$1,242.50	7/19/2019	follow up with counsel for walmart and costco about subpoena responses; research judgment pleadings legal standard and circulate analysis of same
Straub, Craig	Associate	9.75	\$575.00	\$5,606.25	7/22/2019	Wrote Opposition to JOP including time spent finding case law, FDA regulations and scientific studies
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	8.00	\$810.00	\$6,480.00	7/22/2019	research and work on omnibus opposition to motions for judgment on the pleadings
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.50	\$710.00	\$355.00	7/22/2019	meet with LH and CS about MJP opposition and next steps; follow up with costco and walmart counsel about subpoena response
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	0.75	\$710.00	\$532.50	7/23/2019	follow up with costco and walmart about subpoena status and call with Amit R about same; meet with Craig S throughout day about MJP opposiiton and evidence and studies for same
Straub, Craig	Associate	9.00	\$575.00	\$5,175.00	7/23/2019	Deposition summary at direction of attorney P. Brown
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	7/24/2019	correspondence regarding plaintiff depositions, scheduled travel
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	7.25	\$585.00	\$4,241.25	7/24/2019	Researched and drafted section of plaintiffs' motion for class certification re the elements for state claims.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	1.50	\$710.00	\$1,065.00	7/24/2019	work on MJP opposition
Straub, Craig	Associate	8.00	\$575.00	\$4,600.00	7/24/2019	Wrote Opposition to JOP including time spent finding case law, FDA regulations and scientific studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	7/25/2019	follow up about stipulation to continue remand deadline; work on MJP opposition
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	1.50	\$660.00	\$990.00	7/25/2019	correspondence w/plaintiffs regarding depos, booked travel

Timekeeper	Title	Hours	Rate	Lodestar	Date	Description
Straub, Craig	Associate	4.00	\$575.00	\$2,300.00	7/25/2019	Wrote Opposition to JOP including time spent finding case law, FDA regulations and scientific studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	8.25	\$710.00	\$5,857.50	7/26/2019	continue working on MJP opposition; follow up with defense counsel about potential depo dates for pltf's
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.75	\$660.00	\$495.00	7/26/2019	correspondence regarding plaintiff depositions
Brown (Roach), Paula	Partner	0.50	\$660.00	\$330.00	7/27/2019	correspondence w/plaintiff Caiazzo regarding depo
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	2.75	\$585.00	\$1,608.75	7/29/2019	Researched and drafted section of plaintiffs' motion for class certification re the elements for state claims.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	6.25	\$810.00	\$5,062.50	7/29/2019	work on omnibus opposition to mtn for judgment on the pleadings.
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	7.00	\$710.00	\$4,970.00	7/29/2019	meet with LH about MJP opposition and continue working on same
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	7/29/2019	Wrote Opposition to JOP including time spent finding case law, FDA regulations and scientific studies
O'Reardon, Thomas	Partner	10.00	\$710.00	\$7,100.00	7/30/2019	continue working on opposition to MJP and meet with LH throughout day about same; review and revise RJN in connection with MJP oppo
Straub, Craig	Associate	6.00	\$575.00	\$3,450.00	7/30/2019	Wrote request for judicial notice including time spent reading and finding case law.
MacPherson, Jennifer	Of Counsel	7.00	\$585.00	\$4,095.00	7/30/2019	Researched and drafted section of plaintiffs' motion for class certification re the elements for state claims. Cite checked these sections.
Blood, Timothy	Partner	3.25	\$960.00	\$3,120.00	7/31/2019	Work on opposition to motion for judgment on the pleadings in all cases.
Hurst, Leslie	Partner	7.00	\$810.00	\$5,670.00	7/31/2019	work on opposition to Mtn for Judgment on the Pleadings
Straub, Craig	Associate	7.50	\$575.00	\$4,312.50	7/31/2019	Wrote request for judicial notice including time spent reading and finding case law; prepared exhibits for opposition to JOP